M Gma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Inquiry - oxygen sensor
1 message

Maciej Mazur <maciej.mazur@addiving.pl> 2 September 2020 at 08:51
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Dear Ryan,

Accepts and asks for four additional R-17VAN sensors in the same delivery.
Data for invoicing and shipping

ADDIVING s.c.

ul. 9 Szczecinska Street

54-517 Wroclaw

VAT No. 894-315-31-64

Pozdrawiam/Best regards

Maciej Mazur

ADDIVING
Szczecinska 9
54-517 Wroctaw/Poland

Mob: +48 501494247
Email: maciej.mazur@addiving.pl

DIVING

Wiadomos¢ napisana przez Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> w dniu 01.09.2020, o godz. 12:53:
Dear Maciej

| am expecting a small shipment of R-33S1 sensors next week, so hopefully we can supply your order sooner than
we thought if you decide to proceed.

R-33S1 = GBP £35 each
Airmail for two sensors (Tracked & Signed) = GBP £11

Please can you let me know if you have a company VAT number? If yes, please provide the number. If not, then we
would have to add VAT at 20% to the pricing.

| will await your reply.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 27 Aug 2020 at 17:21, Maciej Mazur <maciej.mazur@addiving.pl> wrote:
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Dear Ryan,

thank you for your instant reply :)

Of course, | understand the situation, we will ask for two R-33S1 oxygen sensors.
| will also ask for information about the price with shipping to Poland.

Data for invoicing and shipping

ADDIVING s.c.

ul. 9 Szczecinska Street

54-517 Wroclaw

Pozdrawiam/Best regards
Maciej Mazur

ADDIVING
Szczecinska 9
54-517 Wroctaw/Poland

Mob: +48 501494247
Email: maciej.mazur@addiving.pl

<Maciek podpis.png>

Wiadomosé napisana przez Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> w dniu 27.08.2020, o godz. 15:05:
Thank you for your email.

Please can you confirm which sensors you require? Is it the R-33S1 sensors?

Unfortunately, due to the pandemic, we are struggling for stock of Oxygen Sensors, as all production
has been prioritised towards sensors for medical applications. I had confirmation from the
manufacturer that our next batch of R-33S1 sensors that were due to be shippmed tomorrow have not

been put back to the end of September.

If you are needing the R-33S1, then I would suggest placing your order as soon as possible, so we can
add it to the queue for when stock arrives.

I am very sorry for the inconvenience and I hope that things will settle down to some sort of normality
in the coming months. Please let me know if you have any further questions
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