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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Offer Request
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 2 September 2020 at 11:29
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Sarah Walton
<sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Please can we provide Sarl Hospimedica with a proforma invoice for EyeMax:

43x 1114007
54x 1114006
53x 1114005

Thank you

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Sarl Hospimedica Sarlhospimedica <sarlhospimedica@yahoo.fr>
Date: Wed, 2 Sep 2020 at 11:08
Subject: Re: Offer Request
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,
Thank you for your response.
Please send me a proforma invoice with:
*Eyemask 20-26   Qty:43
*Eyemask 26-32   Qty:54
*Eyemask 32-38   Qty:53

Thank you.
Best Regards.

Sabah
-----------------------------------
M. NEKMOUCHE Mahiddine - Gérant 
SARL HOSPIMEDICA
Cité des Annassers 2 Bt 17 N°2 
Kouba Alger (Coopémad Nord)
Tél.         00 213 23 70 35 73
Fax :       00 213 23 70 35 68
Mobile:    00 213 550 92 92 72
                00 213 560 41 05 52
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Le mercredi 2 septembre 2020 à 10:51:23 UTC+2, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :

Hi Sabah

Please find the EyeMax prices attached. Unfortunately we no longer manufacture or supply O2 hoods, we used to
offer both reusable and single use.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Wed, 2 Sep 2020 at 09:42, Sarl Hospimedica Sarlhospimedica <sarlhospimedica@yahoo.fr> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
Sorry for the delay.
We want to import 200 pac of eyemasks not neomasks, please send the price.
I want to ask you if your hoods are reusable of for one use?
Thank you.
Best Regards.

Sabah
-----------------------------------
M. NEKMOUCHE Mahiddine - Gérant 
SARL HOSPIMEDICA
Cité des Annassers 2 Bt 17 N°2 
Kouba Alger (Coopémad Nord)
Tél.         00 213 23 70 35 73
Fax :       00 213 23 70 35 68
Mobile:    00 213 550 92 92 72
                00 213 560 41 05 52
             

Le mardi 25 août 2020 à 13:11:39 UTC+2, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :

Dear Sabah

I am very well, thank you. I hope you are too.
Thank you very much for your email.

Our best distributor pricing is USD $31.50 / pack of 20.

If you are happy to proceed with an order or would like an official quotation, please let me know the specific
quantities of each size you will require.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Tue, 25 Aug 2020 at 11:42, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Sarl Hospimedica Sarlhospimedica <sarlhospimedica@yahoo.fr>
Date: Tue, 25 Aug 2020 at 11:35
Subject: Offer Request
To: Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,
I hope you are fine.
Can you send me your best price offer for 200 pac of neomask with the diffrent sizes.
Thank you.
Best Regards.

Sabah
-----------------------------------
M. NEKMOUCHE Mahiddine - Gérant 
SARL HOSPIMEDICA
Cité des Annassers 2 Bt 17 N°2 
Kouba Alger (Coopémad Nord)
Tél.         00 213 23 70 35 73
Fax :       00 213 23 70 35 68
Mobile:    00 213 550 92 92 72
                00 213 560 41 05 52
             

EyeMax Phototherapy Eye Masks USD Distributor Price List 2019-01-16.pdf
87K
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