26/08/2020 Gmail - Re: ENVITEC REPLACEMENT 00M102-1

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: ENVITEC REPLACEMENT 00M102-1

1 message

Mohamed Rafiq <mohdrafig@smartlifemedical.com> 26 August 2020 at 16:13
To: "kate.griffiths" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

KATE
PLEASE NOTE

SHIPPING DOOR TO DOOR
SHIPPING / BILLING

MOHAMED RAFIQ

Smartlife Medical & Laboratories Equipments

PO BOX 211013, NEAR FATIMA COLLEGE OF HEALTH SCIENCES ,
VILLA # 755, 3RD ST .MAQAM , AL AIN,

UNITED ARAB EMIRATES.

MOB: +971 50 5230436

Best regards

Mohamed Rafiq

SMART LIFE MEDICAL & LAB EQUIPMENT
PO BOX 211013,AL AIN, UAE

Mob: +971505230436

VAT TRN :100293865000003
mohdrafig@smartlifemedical.com

On Wed, Aug 26, 2020 at 5:43 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Mohamed,

Please could | have the shipping address before you pay so | can amend the proforma invoice? | will need to re-
issue the proforma invoice to you when | have changed the address. When you are ready.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.
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