25/08/2020 Gmail - Re: ENVITEC REPLACEMENT 00M102-1

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: ENVITEC REPLACEMENT 00M102-1

1 message

Mohamed Rafiq <mohdrafig@smartlifemedical.com> 25 August 2020 at 17:03
To: "kate.griffiths" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Kate
Yes, issue the PI.

On Mon, Aug 24, 2020, 10:32 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

q[\/\ED edlcaf o ’
y TYPE:

R-17Vi

Good evening Mohamed,
Thank you for your email.

We can offer part number 0110019 - Oxygen sensor R-17Vi as a replacement for the OOM102-1, please see
attached technical document and photograph above.

This item has a lead time of approximately 4-5 weeks.

The price is $32.50 each EXW.

Please let me know if this is the part you require and | will issue a proforma invoice.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 24 Aug 2020 at 08:07, Mohamed Rafiq <mohdrafig@smartlifemedical.com> wrote:

KATE
I'm looking for a replacement for the Envitec P/N : 00M102 - 1. Please quote to me 5 nos.
Best regards

Mohamed Rafiq

SMART LIFE MEDICAL & LAB EQUIPMENT
PO BOX 211013,AL AIN, UAE

Mob: +971505230436

VAT TRN :100293865000003
mohdrafig@smartlifemedical.com
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