M Gmail

Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: FW: Viamed Purchase Order GG595171

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

------- - Forwarded message -----—--

From: Stork Annette - Support Buyer <annette.stork@uhl-tr.nhs.uk>
Date: Tue, 25 Aug 2020 at 08:20

Subject: FW: Viamed Purchase Order GG595171

To: sophie.lir i 1.co.uk <sophie.lir i 1.co.uk>

Hi Sophie

I have amended our order and added £8.00 for carriage please proceed with this order.

Kind Regards

#helle my name is...
~

Annette Stork

Support Buyer

Procurement and Supplies

University Hospitals of Leicester NHS Trust
Finance & Procurement Directorate
County Hall, Room G60

Glenfield, Leicester
LE3 8TB

Tel: 0116 2583242

Email: annette.stork@uhl-tr.nhs.uk

Supplier Notice:

To have the opportunity to bid for contracts advertised by the University Hospitals of Leicester please register at:

https://procontract.due-north.com/ [vsea.xuhl-tr.nhs.uk]

skills Development Network
Towards Excellence Procurement
m NHS Standards of Procurement - Level 2

Achieving - making good, strong progress

From: Stork Annette - Support Buyer

Sent: 24 August 2020 15:47

To: 'sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk' <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: FW: Viamed Purchase Order GG595171

Hi Sophie

Tue, Aug 25, 2020 at 8:21 AM

Thank you for the email below saying we need to add a carriage charge to GG595171. Can you let me know why there is an £8.00 charge as the last pricing agreement | have, agreed with Catrin Hollings states these items as Delivery excluded (see

attached email from Catrin Hollings.

| have not been contacted so | presume the attached prices are still valid.

Please let me know if this has changed.

Thanks

Kind Regards

#helle my name is...
~

Annette Stork

Support Buyer

Procurement and Supplies

University Hospitals of Leicester NHS Trust
Finance & Procurement Directorate
County Hall, Room G60

Glenfield, Leicester
LE3 8TB

Tel: 0116 2583242

Email: annette.stork@uhl-tr.nhs.uk

Supplier Notice:

©W2METRES W &
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To have the opportunity to bid for contracts advertised by the University Hospitals of Leicester please register at:

https://procontract.due-north.com/ [vsea.xuhl-tr.nhs.uk]

skills Developr

Towards Excellence Procurement
m- NHS Standards of Procurement - Level 2

Achieving - making good, strong progress

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
Sent: 24 August 2020 14:24

To: Burgess Jennifer - Senior Sister; UHL Supplies

Subject: Purchase Order GG595171

Dear Jennifer,

Thank you for your order GG595171.

Please be aware there is a carriage charge of £8.00 applicable on this order.

Please can you confirm whether you are happy for us to proceed?

Could you please advise if carriage charges are accepted on orders, or do we need you to approve these before proceeding?

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My current working days are Monday and Friday 9.00am-5pm

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow office staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers
as best we can.

hitp:/fwww.viamed. co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twit

ter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on i, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

This e-mail, including any attached files, may contain confidential and / or privileged information and is intended for the exclusive use of the addressee(s) printed above. If you are not the addressee(s), any unauthorised review, disclosure, reproduction, other dissemination or use of this e-mail, or taking of any action in reliance upon
the information contained herein, is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail has been sent to you in error, please return to the sender. No guarantee can be given that the contents of this email are virus free - The University Hospitals of Leicester NHS Trust cannot be held responsible for any failure by the recipient(s) to test for viruses before
opening any attachments. The information contained in this e-mail may be the subject of public disclosure under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - unless legally exempt from disclosure, the confidentiality of this e-mail and your reply cannot be guaranteed. Copyright in this email and any attachments created by us remains
vested in the University Hospitals of Leicester NHS Trust

- Forwarded message
From: Catrin Hollings <ofﬂce@\/|amed co.uk>

To: Stork Annette - Support Buyer <annette.stork@uhl-tr.nhs.uk>

Cc:

Bec:

Date: Wed, 17 Jun 2020 11:37:20 +0000

Subject: Re: FW: Pricing agreement (one months notice) DN1343896 1 - Viamed - Oxygen sensors & assosiated consumables
Hi Annette,

Unfortunately it is still being worked on, we will be in touch when we have new pricing.
For the time being, please see the prices as valid.

Kind regards

Catrin Hollings

Marketing
Viamed Ltd.

Please note: Viamed is now i plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may
take longer to process but we aim to contmue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: catrin.hollings@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Skype: viamed.catrin.hird

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 17 Jun 2020 at 12:23, Stork Annette - Support Buyer <annette.stork@uhl-tr.nhs.uk> wrote:

Dear Catrin

| hope you are well.

How are your management team progressing with finalising the last few prices on your pricing review?
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Thanks

Kind Regards

# B my name is...

Annette Stork

Support Buyer

Procurement and Supplies

University Hospitals of Leicester NHS Trust
Finance & Procurement Directorate
County Hall, Room G60

Glenfield, Leicester
LE3 8T8

Tel: 0116 2583242

Email: annette.stork@uhl-tr.nhs.uk

Supplier Notice:
To have the opportunity to bid for contracts advertised by the University Hospitals of Leicester please register at:

https://procontract.due-north.com/ [vsea.xuhl-tr.nhs.uk]

Skills Development Netw

Towards Excellence Procurement
m NHS Standards of Procurement - Level 2

Achieving - making good, strong progress

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Catrin Hollings

Sent: 03 June 2020 14:39

To: Stork Annette - Support Buyer <annette.stork@uhl-tr.nhs.uk>

Subject: Re: FW: Pricing agreement DN1343896 1 - Viamed - Oxygen sensors & assosiated consumables

Dear Annette,

Thank you for your email regarding pricing from Viamed. As a small family run business we are currently working very hard to supply the NHS with the vital products it requires to deal with this current pandemic. Unfortunately, due to this we have not yet
been able to complete our full pricing review for 2020 as yet.

Therefore, | have reviewed the pricing which you have supplied to the attached email and can confirm that they are correct, at present. Once we have completed our pricing review we will be sending out updated pricing spreadsheets to all customers
providing the 30 days notice as requested by the NHS, where possible.

Should you have any questions in the meantime please do not hesitate in contacting me.
Kind regards
Catrin Hollings

Marketing
Viamed Ltd.

Please note: Viamed is now plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders
may take longer to process but we aim !o conllnue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: catrin.hollings@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Skype: viamed.catrin.hird

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 21 Apr 2020 at 15:51, Stork Annette - Support Buyer <annette.stork@uhl-tr.nhs.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Catrin

The University Hospitals of Leicester requires a pricing agreement extension for a minimum of 12 Months effective from 1st July 2020
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A fixed price is required to allow upload onto the UHL in house e-catalogue which will assist in improved efficiency with purchasing and prompt invoice payments.

The Trust may request / require amendments throughout the duration.

Please indicate the Manufactures Product Code and Gtin Codes (Column 4) and confirm the unit of issue and any applicable Standard Delivery charges

*
Please complete/amend all highlighted fields

The agreement below is due to expire on 30 June 2020

Agreement Start Date *
015t July 2020

Agreement End Date *

University Hospitals of Leicester (UHL) is currently reviewing all its pricing agreements and working with suppliers to reduce UHL's cost.

As a valued supplier, you will be aware from our recent communications that the NHS is facing unprecedented financial challenges. We have been asked by the Government to achieve savings totalling £20 billion over a 4
year period and the Department of Health has advised of the need to resist price increases from our suppliers.

Kind Regards

# B my name is...
Annette Stork
Support Buyer
Procurement and Supplies

University Hospitals of Leicester NHS Trust

16a UHL Supplier code | 17. Supplier Product | 17a MPC Code 17b GTIN Code 18. Description of 19. Unit of 20. 21. NHS List 22. Contract 23.EClass - count Code
Code (Manufacturers (Global Trade Item | Product (max 4 Lines Measure - Quantity of | Price per Unit Price per Unit 3 Character it
Product Code) Number) of 45 Characters) Each, Pack, Measure - | of Measure of Measure
Pair, Box etc. 1,10 20 (excluding (excluding
etc. /AT)

Courier delivery Standard only
1VMLOO000A PPUPS1 CARRIAGE A CARRIAGE A where item marked (DELIVERY EA 1 £10.00 £10.00 ZWC 1556
CLUDED)

R-43V Oxygen Sensor Datex-
1VML00001 0110043 R43V 5051826003442 | Onmeda Pack of 2 sensors. For PA 2 £90.00 £90.00 FDP 1052
use with GE Datex Ohmeda

Giraffe

R-43V Oxygen Sensor Datex-
Ohmeda Pack of 2 sensors. For
0110043 use with GE Datex Ohmeda PA 2 £81.00 £81.00 FDP 1052

Giraffe 2 PACKS

R-43V Oxygen Sensor Datex-
Ohmeda Pack of 2 sensors. For
0110043 use with GE Datex Ohmeda PA 2 £76.50 £76.50 FDP 1052

Giraffe 3 TO 10 PACKS

R-43V Oxygen Sensor Datex-
Ohmeda Pack of 2 sensors. For
0110043 use with GE Datex Ohmeda PA 2 £72.00 £72.00 FDP 1052

Giraffe 11 PACKS PLUS

SpiroTrue Flow Sensor A (PC)

1VML00003 4310002 7030131001 5051826016732 Replacement for the Drager BOX 5 £60.00 £60.00 FDP 1052
SpiroLife flow sensor part no.

MK 01900 BOX OF 5

R-17MED Oxygen Sensor EA 1

1VML00004 0110017 C43690-R17MED | 5051826000700 g £42.00 £42.00 FDP 1052
0110017 R'ﬁe“f';fy’n‘;"zyg‘geo“fss”s"' EA 1 £38.00 £38.00 FOP 1052
0110017 ?élg";fe':’gg%e;;g;%‘g EA 1 £36.00 £36.00 FDP 1052
0110017 TZ]lz;‘,”nEe[ﬂ e . EA 1 £34.00 £34.00 FDP 1052
1VMLO00005 0110022 C44611-R22MED | 5051826000717 R'zzMEDV?:SVf:” Sensor EA 1 £42.00 £42.00 FDP 1052
0110022 R'zz\wfszfgfgigg”“’ EA 1 £38.00 £38.00 FDP 1052
0110022 R\-/?azs’\cfg g e EA 1 £36.00 £36.00 FOP 1052
0110022 Fi]ézs?,ﬂfﬂ Qg Sorser EA 1 £34.00 £34.00 FDP 1052
R-23V Oxygen Sensor Drager
1VML00006 0110023 C61339-R23 5051826000724 | for Draeger 6850645 Oxygen EA 1 £42.00 £42.00 FDP 1052

sensor

R-23V Oxygen Sensor Drager
0110023 for Draeger 6850645 Oxygen EA 1 £38.00 £38.00 FDP 1052
sensor 2 BOXES

R-23V Oxygen Sensor Drager
0110023 for Draeger 6850645 Oxygen EA 1 £36.00 £36.00 FDP 1052
sensor 3 TO 10 BOXES

0110023 R-23V Oxygen Sensor Drager EA 1 £34.00 £34.00 FDP 1052




]

1VML00007

for Draeger 6850645 Oxygen
sensor 11 PLUS BOXES

0110024

110024

5051826000731

R-24MED Oxygen Sensor
Siemens

EA

£42.00

£42.00

FDP

1052

0110024

R-24MED Oxygen Sensor
Siemens 2 BOXES

EA

£38.00

£38.00

[Message clipped] View entire message
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