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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order
2 messages

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 22 May 2019 at 13:55
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Norik-sub <norik@norik-sub.si>
Date: Wed, 22 May 2019 at 13:18
Subject: Order
To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi!

We are ordering:

3  x R-17VAN Oxygen sensor (for VN202/Tek-Ox/Miniox/MD300/AD300)

1 x R-33S1 Oxygen sensor (for Mixchek)

Delivery by post, payment by credit card. You have credit card number on file.

Best regards,
Igor Vrhovec

-------------------------------
Norik-sub d.o.o.
Celovska 25
SI-1000 Ljubljana
Slovenia
tel: +386 1 4340753
fax: +386 1 2301907
e-mail: norik@norik-sub.si
internet: www.norik-sub.si
-------------------------------

---
This email has been checked for viruses by AVG.
https://www.avg.com

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 24 August 2020 at 13:13
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

I am sure we can find the CC details.

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Norik-sub <norik@norik-sub.si>
Date: Mon, 24 Aug 2020 at 12:53
Subject: Order
To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Dear Ryan!

We are ordering:

3  x R-17VAN Oxygen sensor (for VN202/Tek-Ox/Miniox/MD300/AD300)

1 x R-33S1 Oxygen sensor (for Mixchek)

Delivery by post, payment by credit card. Do oyu still have credit card details on file?

Best regards,
Igor Vrhovec

-------------------------------
Norik-sub d.o.o.
Celovska 25
SI-1000 Ljubljana
Slovenia
tel: +386 1 4340753
fax: +386 1 2301907
e-mail: norik@norik-sub.si
internet: www.norik-sub.si
-------------------------------

-- 
[Quoted text hidden]
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