20/08/2020 Gmail - Re: Quotations

M Gma“ Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: Quotations
1 message

Wynfrey Wong <wynfrey.wong@gmail.com> 20 August 2020 at 12:13
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sarah,

It's Wynfrey again. How are you doing these days? Hope you are well.
Please give me a proforma invoice of those parts in the attached file.
Thanks and best regards,

Wynfrey Wong

On Thu, Aug 6, 2020 at 1:46 PM Wynfrey Wong <wynfrey.wong@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sarah,

Thank you for your email.
Best Regards,

Wynfrey Wong

On Mon, Aug 3, 2020 at 4:06 PM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Wynfrey,

Thank you for your email.

Please see the prices below in blue.

Oxygen sensor R-47V 0110047 $ 69.00 per unit EXW
Oxygen sensor MAX-550E 0110452 $91.00

Oxygen monitor MaxO2+AE 0111261 $ 294.00

T-tube 22mm OD 0120104 $ 10.00

T-tube 22mm OD 0120108 $4.36

Connector 22 ID-22mm ID 0120125 $2.00

Connector 15mm ID-22mmOD 0120126 $ 1.74

Connector 22mm OD-30mm OD 0120129 $ 1.87

Connector 15MM OD-tapered darb 0120130 $2.50

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@yviamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 3 Aug 2020 at 04:21, Wynfrey Wong <wynfrey.wong@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sarah,

Hope you are well at the current CORVID situation.

| need some more quotations of the parts in the catalogue you have sent to me with part number of
9990101.Thay are listed below.

Oxygen sensor R-47V 0110047

Oxygen sensor MAX-550E 0110452

Oxygen monitor MaxO2+AE 0111261(0111262)
T-tube 22mm OD 0120104

T-tube 22mm OD 0120108
Connector 22 ID-22mm ID 0120125
Connector 15mm ID-22mmOD 0120126
Connector 22mm OD-30mm OD 0120129
Connector 15MM OD-tapered darb 0120130

Thanks and best regards,

Wynfrey Wong

@ ViaMed.xlIsx
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