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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: o2 cell
1 message

Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com> 7 August 2020 at 09:20
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Please make them 3 O2 cells to order one shot.

If possible for you, can you send me the picture of the O2 cell to confirm the shape and the connexion is correct?

 

Regards

Marc Salameh

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 07 August 2020 10:51
To: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com>
Subject: Re: o2 cell

 

Good morning Marc,

 

Please see attached proforma invoice as requested.

 

Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely.
Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Fri, 7 Aug 2020 at 07:18, Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com> wrote:

Well noted.

Please provide me an official offer to start our work together.

Below our details;

Company Name: C.M.M. sal Supplies & Services

Address: Sin el Fil – Fouad Chehab Avenue – Vanlian Center – 3rd floor

Phone: +961 1 512 820

Mobile: +961 3 137 314

Contact: Marc Salameh – Service Coordinator

Managing director: Jihad Melki ( Owner)

Country: Lebanon

 

We will pay via bank transfer to your account.

 

Please advise

Regards

Marc Salameh

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 06 August 2020 12:02
To: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com>
Subject: Re: o2 cell

 

Good morning Marc,

 

Thank you for your email.

 

Unfortunately, I am unable to give you any better news about the lead time.  We would ship as soon as the sensors are available.

 

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges etc; I would need your delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.  

 

Our bank details would show on the proforma invoice to enable you to make a bank transfer.  Alternatively, you could pay by paypal which incurs a 6% fee of the total
order.

 

Please let me know if I can be of any further assistance.

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely.
Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, 6 Aug 2020 at 09:39, Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

We will need to order 2 units of the below O2 cell.

Can you please provide me more details about the process and the transfer of the payment.

Cant you help to have the cells in a short period?

 

Regards

Marc Salameh

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 24 July 2020 12:12
To: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com>
Subject: Re: o2 cell

 

Good morning Marc,

 

Thank you for your enquiry.

 

The price breaks for our item 0110081, UFO 130-2 are as follows:

 

1 = $ 187.85 each 2 = $ 169.07 each 3-10 = $ 159.67 each [ ] 11+ = $ 150.28 each

 

Unfortunately the lead time for this item is November, although we are working towards improving this. 

 

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges etc; I would need your delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.

 

Please let me know if I can be of any further assistance.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely.
Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve
our customers as best we can.
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 24 Jul 2020 at 09:16, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com>
Date: Fri, 24 Jul 2020 at 09:13
Subject: RE: o2 cell
To: Mora, Victoria <Victoria.Mora@teledyne.com>, info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

 

Dear Mora,

Thank you for you feedback and great support.

 

 

Dear Sirs from Viamed,

Can you please help with the below. We need an offer and information’s about the payment transfer.

We need the attached O2 cell. I think your P/N is UFO-130-2? For you to confirm.

 

Regards

 

 

 

 

 

From: Mora, Victoria <Victoria.Mora@Teledyne.com> 
Sent: 23 July 2020 05:20
To: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com>
Subject: RE: o2 cell
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Good morning,

 

Thank you for confirming, however we have an exclusive representative in your location that will be able to further assist you with your current and future
inquiries. Please see their contact details below:

 

Viamed Limited
(Medical Sensors Only)
15 Station Road
Cross Hills
Keighley, BD20 7DT
United Kingdom
Tel: 44 0 1535 634542
Fax: 44 0 1535 635582
Email: info@viamed.co.uk
www.viamed.co.uk

 

 

 

 

For more International Territories please visit our website: http://www.teledyne-ai.com/Contact/Pages/Worldwide_Map.aspx

 

 

 

Thank you,

 

Victoria Mora

 

Teledyne Analytical Instruments

16830 Chestnut St • City of Industry, CA 91748

Direct: 626.934.1565|  Victoria.Mora@teledyne.com

 

Seller’s Offer, and any order issued by Buyer to Seller for the goods and/or services specified herein, is strictly limited to Seller’s General Terms and Conditions of Sale, which
can be found at www.teledyne-ai.com.

NOTICE: This email message and all attachments transmitted with it are intended solely for the use of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and confidential
information. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or other use of this message and its attachments is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
notify the sender immediately by replying to this message and please delete it from your computer.

 

 

From: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 20, 2020 11:10 PM
To: Mora, Victoria <Victoria.Mora@Teledyne.com>
Subject: RE: o2 cell

 

External Email

Hello Mora,

Please find below all requested details and will be waiting for your offer.

The O2 cell is required to be replaced for a PFT machine. Attached its picture.

You can also visit our website to know more about CMM. We are distributors for many brands coming from USA ( General Electric, Exergen, Natus…) and many
other brands from other countries.

Regards
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From: Mora, Victoria <Victoria.Mora@Teledyne.com> 
Sent: 21 July 2020 03:33
To: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com>
Subject: RE: o2 cell

 

Good afternoon,

 

I would like to assist you with your order. Can you please advise how this unit will be used? Also, please provide the Teledyne part number.

 

Teledyne Analytical Instruments runs a Denied Parties Screening (DPS) on each quote to comply with the

U.S. Government exporting guidelines. 

 

Please provide the following so we can run accurate screening.

 

Full First and Last Name: Marc Salameh
Full Business Name: C.M.M. sal Supplies & Services
Business Address: Lebanon – Sin el fil – Fouad Chehab Avenue – Vanlian Center – 3rd floor
Business Website: www.cmm-hc.com

 

 

If you have an End User, please provide the following:

 

End Use Full Contact Name: Mr. Kamal Slim – Managing director
End Use Business Name: Doctors Center Hospital
End Use Business Address: Hamra - Lebanon
End Use Business Website: N/A

 

 

Once I have all information and run the screening I can provide you with a quote.

 

 

 

Thank you,

 

Victoria Mora

 

Teledyne Analytical Instruments

16830 Chestnut St • City of Industry, CA 91748

Direct: 626.934.1565|  Victoria.Mora@teledyne.com

 

Seller’s Offer, and any order issued by Buyer to Seller for the goods and/or services specified herein, is strictly limited to Seller’s General Terms and Conditions of Sale, which
can be found at www.teledyne-ai.com.
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NOTICE: This email message and all attachments transmitted with it are intended solely for the use of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and confidential
information. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or other use of this message and its attachments is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
notify the sender immediately by replying to this message and please delete it from your computer.

 

From: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com> 
Sent: Sunday, July 19, 2020 11:04 PM
To: Mora, Victoria <Victoria.Mora@Teledyne.com>
Subject: RE: o2 cell

 

External Email

Dear Sir,

Yes we will be asking you to ship the O2 cell to Lebanon.

We will transfer the amount required in advance and we will take care of all shipping process. We will coordinate with DHL to pick up the goods and ship the to our
country.

Our company name is CMM sal Supplies & Services

We are a medical company 40 years ago. We are GE Healthcare Distributors.

Our address is: Sin el Fil – Vanlian Center – Fuad Chehab Avenue – Lebanon

Phone: 00961 1 512 820

 

Awaiting your quote please.

Regards

 

 

 

 

 

From: Mora, Victoria <Victoria.Mora@Teledyne.com> 
Sent: 17 July 2020 07:24
To: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com>
Subject: RE: o2 cell

 

Good morning,

 

I would like to assist you with your quote, can you please advise if you will be exporting our product out of the US at any time? Also, the item number is invalid
can you please review?

 

Teledyne Analytical Instruments runs a Denied Parties Screening (DPS) on each quote and order to comply with the U.S. Government exporting guidelines.

 

Please provide the following so we can run accurate screening and locate an account with us.

 

Full First and Last Name:
Full Business Name:
Business Address:

 

mailto:support@cmm-hc.com
mailto:Victoria.Mora@Teledyne.com
mailto:Victoria.Mora@Teledyne.com
mailto:support@cmm-hc.com


07/08/2020 Gmail - RE: o2 cell

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1673085402526451231%7Cmsg-f%3A167435403… 8/10

Please Note: This product is part of our medical line and all our medical products are considered to be prescription items, which may only ship to hospitals or
facilities in the U.S. that have a Medical License or have a local Medical Registration.

 

Please provide a copy of one of the following:

• FDA License: For production and distribution of medical devices in the US.

• DEA License: Allows health care providers to write prescriptions for controlled products.

• Local or State Health Care Registration: Issued by local or state health authorities.

• Doctor’s License: Licensees are authorized to use prescription substances and write prescriptions for controlled substances.

 

 

Once I have all information and run the screening I can provide you with a quote.

 

 

 

Thank you,

 

Victoria Mora

 

Teledyne Analytical Instruments

16830 Chestnut St • City of Industry, CA 91748

Direct: 626.934.1565|  Victoria.Mora@teledyne.com

 

Seller’s Offer, and any order issued by Buyer to Seller for the goods and/or services specified herein, is strictly limited to Seller’s General Terms and Conditions of Sale, which
can be found at www.teledyne-ai.com.

NOTICE: This email message and all attachments transmitted with it are intended solely for the use of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and confidential
information. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or other use of this message and its attachments is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
notify the sender immediately by replying to this message and please delete it from your computer.

 

From: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com> 
Sent: Friday, July 17, 2020 12:33 AM
To: Mora, Victoria <Victoria.Mora@Teledyne.com>; Acosta, Luz <Luz.Acosta@Teledyne.com>; Sicairos, Desiree <Desiree.Sicairos@Teledyne.com>
Subject: RE: o2 cell

 

External Email

 

 

Dear Sir,

My name is Marc Salameh. We are a medical company in Lebanon.

Can you please quote for S776206 - O2 cell Teledyne.

 

Regards
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---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: Marc Salameh <marc_s86@hotmail.com>
To: Marc Salameh <support@cmm-hc.com>
Cc: 
Bcc: 
Date: Tue, 21 Jul 2020 06:07:29 +0000
Subject: 
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