06/08/2020 Gmail - Re: Inquiry quotation Oxygen sensor (VHCM) 02.03.2020

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Inquiry quotation Oxygen sensor (VHCM) 02.03.2020

1 message

Dimovietnam.purchase dept Ms. Yen <minhyen@dimovietnam.com> 6 August 2020 at 10:50
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk, "Dept DIMOVIETNAM.Purchase" <purchase.dept@dimovietham.com>

Dear Ms Kate,

DIMO FedEx Account: 670434885

Thanks & Best regards

Ms. Minh Yen

Purchase dept.

Mobile: (+84) 98 2026 445

VIET NAM DIMO INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES., JSC

Head Office: No.09-B14, Lane 15, Ham Nghi Street, Cau Dien Ward, Nam Tu Liem District, Ha Noi

HCM Office: No.11A, Hong Ha Street, Ward 2, Tan Binh District, Ho Chi Minh
Skype: purchasedimo03
Tel: (+84) 243 992 5886

Website: http://dimovietnam.com
Email: minhyen@dimovietnam.com

WhatsApp: +84 98 202 64 45
QQ: 3045463443

Vao Th 5, 6 thg 8, 2020 vao luc 16:15 Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> d4 viét:
Good morning Ms Yen,

Thank you for your payment.

Please could | ask you for your Fedex account number?
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will.
Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
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reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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06/08/2020 Gmail - Re: Inquiry quotation Oxygen sensor (VHCM) 02.03.2020

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 6 Aug 2020 at 02:58, Dimovietnam.purchase dept Ms. Yen <minhyen@dimovietnam.com> wrote:
Dear Ms Kate,
Kindly check the proof of payment in the attached file.

Thanks & Best regards

Ms. Minh Yen

Purchase dept.

Mobile: (+84) 98 2026 445

VIET NAM DIMO INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES., JSC

Head Office: No.09-B14, Lane 15, Ham Nghi Street, Cau Dien Ward, Nam Tu Liem District, Ha Noi

HCM Office: No.11A, Hong Ha Street, Ward 2, Tan Binh District, Ho Chi Minh
Skype: purchasedimo03

Tel: (+84) 243 992 5886
Website: http://dimovietnam.com
Email: minhyen@dimovietnam.com

WhatsApp: +84 98 202 64 45
QQ: 3045463443

Vao Th 3, 4 thg 8, 2020 vao luc 18:02 Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Good morning Ms Yen,

Thank you for your purchase order. Please see attached proforma invoice. | have updated the addresses and PO
number.

Please let me know if you need any further assistance.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but
emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as
best we can.
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Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
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On Tue, 4 Aug 2020 at 10:46, Dimovietnam.purchase dept Ms. Yen <minhyen@dimovietnam.com> wrote:
Dear Mrs Kate,
Please check and confirm the order in attachment.
If you need any further information please let me know.

Thanks & Best regards

Ms. Minh Yen

Purchase dept.

Mobile: (+84) 98 2026 445

VIET NAM DIMO INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES., JSC

Head Office: No.09-B14, Lane 15, Ham Nghi Street, Cau Dien Ward, Nam Tu Liem District, Ha Noi

HCM Office: No.11A, Hong Ha Street, Ward 2, Tan Binh District, Ho Chi Minh
Skype: purchasedimo03
Tel: (+84) 243 992 5886

Website: http://dimovietnam.com
Email: minhyen@dimovietnam.com

WhatsApp: +84 98 202 64 45
QQ: 3045463443

Vao Th 3, 4 thg 8, 2020 vao ltc 16:22 Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Good morning Ms Yen,

The currency is US dollars. Please let me know if you would like me to change the currency or make any
other changes.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
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taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 4 Aug 2020 at 10:13, Dimovietnam.purchase dept Ms. Yen <minhyen@dimovietnam.com> wrote:
Dear Mrs Kate,
Could you please tell me the currency in your quotation? GBP?
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I'm going to send you the order soon.
Please kindly give me feedback.

Thanks & Best regards

Ms. Minh Yen

Purchase dept.

Mobile: (+84) 98 2026 445

VIET NAM DIMO INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES., JSC

Head Office: No.09-B14, Lane 15, Ham Nghi Street, Cau Dien Ward, Nam Tu Liem District, Ha Noi

HCM Office: No.11A, Hong Ha Street, Ward 2, Tan Binh District, Ho Chi Minh
Skype: purchasedimo03
Tel: (+84) 243 992 5886

Website: http://dimovietnam.com
Email: minhyen@dimovietnam.com

WhatsApp: +84 98 202 64 45
QQ: 3045463443

Vé)o Th 3, 4 thg 8, 2020 vao luc 15:33 Dept DIMOVIETNAM.Purchase <purchase.dept@dimovietnam.com> da
viét:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

Tir: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Th 3, 4 thg 8, 2020 vao luc 14:37

Subject: Re: Inquiry quotation Oxygen sensor (VHCM) 02.03.2020

To: Dept DIMOVIETNAM.Purchase <purchase.dept@dimovietnam.com>

Good morning,
Please see attached proforma invoice as requested.
The lead time could be as long as 12 weeks for this item, from date of payment.

Please let me know if you need me to make any changes to the proforma invoice, please could you check
the addresses are correct.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff
to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be
answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and
serve our customers as best we can.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be

taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 3 Aug 2020 at 12:40, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Dept DIMOVIETNAM.Purchase <purchase.dept@dimovietnam.com>

Date: Mon, 3 Aug 2020 at 12:34

Subject: Fwd: Inquiry quotation Oxygen sensor (VHCM) 02.03.2020

To: <office@viamed.co.uk>, Dept DIMOVIETNAM.Purchase <purchase.dept@dimovietnam.com>

Dear Mr Kate,

| will order this,

My staff you send you the order for this,
Thank you so much,

Hi Yen,

Please make an order send for Mr Kate,

We can to use FedEx for delivery so no need add fee delivery on order
Thank you so much,

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

Tir: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Th 2, 2 thg 3, 2020 vao luc 18:27

Subject: Re: Inquiry quotation Oxygen sensor (VHCM) 02.03.2020

To: Dept DIMOVIETNAM.Purchase <purchase.dept@dimovietnam.com>

Good morning Ms Ha Bui,
Thank you for your email.
| have attached a proforma invoice as requested.

This item has a lead time of approximately 3-4 weeks from date of payment.

Please could | ask you to check the addresses on the proforma invoice? If you require any changes to be
made, please let me know.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Giriffiths
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Gmail - Re: Inquiry quotation Oxygen sensor (VHCM) 02.03.2020

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, Mar 2, 2020 at 3:25 AM Dept DIMOVIETNAM.Purchase <purchase.dept@dimovietnam.com>

wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please check and quote help me inquiry follows:
Oxygen

Model: KE-25F4

P/N: 171101

Maker: GS Yuasa

Qty: 05 pcs

Please check and quote help me soon
Thank you so much,

Thanks & Best regards

Ms. Ha Bui

Purchase Manager.

Mobile: (+84) 0974 21 94 96

VIET NAM DIMO INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES., JSC

Add: No.46, lane 139 My Dinh Street, My Dinh 2, Nam Tu Liem, Ha Noi
Office : 3nd Floor, No.09 B14, Lane 15, Ham Nghi Street, Cau Dien Ward, Nam Tu Liem District, Ha
Noi

Tel: (+84) 0243 992 5886/ 0243 996 5886 - Fax: (+84) 024 3203 3322
Website: http://dimovietnam.com

Email: purchase.dept@dimovietnam.com ;

Skype: buihavcu

Whatsapp: +84 914602986

Thanks & Best regards

Ms. Ha Bui

Purchase Manager.

Mobile: (+84) 0914602986

VIET NAM DIMO INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES., JSC

Add: No.9-B14, Lane 15, Ham Nghi Street, Cau Dien Ward, Nam Tu Liem District, Ha Noi City, Viet
Nam

HCM Office: 11A Hong Ha Street, Ward 2, Tan Binh District, Ho Chi Minh City, Viet Nam
Tel: (+84) 0243 992 5886/ 0243 996 5886 - Fax: (+84) 024 3203 3322

Website: http://dimovietnam.com

Email: purchase.dept@dimovietnam.com ;

Skype: buihavcu

Whatsapp: +84 914602986

Zalo: +84 914602986

Thanks & Best regards

Ms. Ha Bui

Purchase Manager.

Mobile: (+84) 0914602986

VIET NAM DIMO INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES., JSC

Add: No.9-B14, Lane 15, Ham Nghi Street, Cau Dien Ward, Nam Tu Liem District, Ha Noi City, Viet Nam
HCM Office: 11A Hong Ha Street, Ward 2, Tan Binh District, Ho Chi Minh City, Viet Nam
Tel: (+84) 0243 992 5886/ 0243 996 5886 - Fax: (+84) 024 3203 3322

Website: http://dimovietnam.com

Email: purchase.dept@dimovietnam.com ;

Skype: buihavcu

Whatsapp: +84 914602986

Zalo: +84 914602986
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