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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Medical Oxygen Sensor
1 message

Vagelis Rousopoulos <vrousso@gmail.com> 5 August 2020 at 21:22
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi its me again Vagelis from Greece. 
Can i have 1 oxygen sensor like that you sent last time? Unfortunately one of the two i bought the last time was not worked.
No respond at all. At the moment I can not use the gas analyzer in my lab and i stopped working. So could you please sent it
express. I really need it as soon as possible. 
I am waiting for your reply

Regards
Vagelis Rousopoulos
M.Sc, & Ph.D Sports & Exercise Science
mob:00306973023277
e-mail:vrousso@gmail.com

On Mon, Jul 23, 2018 at 3:05 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon

Please find enclosed proforma for your attention.

Many thanks.

On Fri, Jul 20, 2018 at 7:57 PM, Vagelis Rousopoulos <vrousso@gmail.com> wrote:
Yes please. The address is the same and I would like to have 2 oxygen sensors please. I would pay with paypal 
Thanks 

On Fri, 20 Jul 2018 at 16:40, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon Vagelis,

The price for a R-22MED oxygen sensor, part number 0110022 varies upon quantity purchased, as below:

1 = €56.00 2 = €50.40 3 = €47.76 11 = €44.80

As I mentioned before,  we cannot accept credit card payments.

If you would like a proforma invoice, I would need your invoice and delivery addresses.  Are they both: 

Lochagou Chatzievagelou 5a, 
Elliniko
PC:16777
Athens 
Greece.

I await your reply.

Thank you for your enquiry.

-- 
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Fri, Jul 20, 2018 at 11:46 AM, Vagelis Rousopoulos <vrousso@gmail.com> wrote:
No worries, thanks for the update. 
Regards!

Rousopoulos Vagelis
Ph.D Sports & Exercise Science
mob:00306973023277
e-mail:vrousso@gmail.com

On Fri, Jul 20, 2018 at 12:17 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Apologies for the delay, I need to talk with our Export Sales Manager who is in this afternoon.  I will reply as soon
as possible.  Please note we cannot accept credit card payments, but can offer BACS.  Or a paypal payment with
a 6% fee.

I will reply to you as soon as I can.

Many thanks for your patience.

-- 
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, Jul 19, 2018 at 1:51 PM, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

On 19 July 2018 at 13:39, Vagelis Rousopoulos <vrousso@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi could you please send me an R-22MED oxygen sensor in Greece. 
My address is 
Lochagou Chatzievagelou 5a, 
Elliniko
PC:16777
Athens 
Greece.

I can pay with my credit card if you send me an invoice
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Regards!

Rousopoulos Vagelis
Ph.D Sports & Exercise Science
mob:00306973023277
e-mail:vrousso@gmail.com

-- 
Regards!

Rousopoulos Vagelis
Ph.D Sports & Exercise Science
mob:00306973023277
e-mail:vrousso@gmail.com

-- 
Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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