
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Tek Ox
1 message

Francesca <Francesca@kidsor.org> 28 July 2020 at 15:00
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

Thank you for your email. I’m a little confused by the oxygen concentrator adapter – how does the outflow of test gas happen?

 

Please find attached our vat exemption certificate.

 

Francesca Aras
Biomedical Engineer
 
Kids Opera�ng Room
86 Kingsway East
Dundee
DD4 8SL
 
DD: +44 (0) 7741 322242

 

     

 
Kids Opera�ng Room Limited is a registered charity in Scotland (SC048523) at 4th Floor, 107 George Street, Edinburgh, EH2 3ES  
 
Disclaimer
This message is intended only for the use of the person(s) ("Intended Recipient") to whom it is addressed. It may contain informa�on which is privileged and confiden�al. Accordingly any
dissemina�on, distribu�on, copying or other use of this message or any of its content by any person other than the Intended Recipient may cons�tute a breach of civil or criminal law and is strictly
prohibited. If you are not the Intended Recipient, please contact the sender as soon as possible.

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 2:01:01 PM
To: Francesca <Francesca@kidsor.org>
Subject: Re: Tek Ox

 

Hi Francesca

 

It was nice to speak to you, thank you for your enquiry.

 

Please send me your VAT exemption certificate and I will forward you a proforma invoice with our account details.

 

I have attached a picture of the T piece that I intend to supply. After I put the phone down, I thought about another option; we can supply you with an O2 concentrator adapter, I
have also attached a picture of this. Please let me know which adapter/T Piece you would prefer?

 

I look forward to your response and please let me know if you have any questions.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 27 Jul 2020 at 15:55, Francesca <Francesca@kidsor.org> wrote:

Dear Vandargraph team,

We’re looking to purchase a  Tek Ox oxygen analyser.  Would you be able to provide a VAT-free invoice? We are a registered charity and can provide a VAT exemption
certificate.

 

Could you advise if these are in stock and what your approximate delivery times are?

 

Many thanks,

 

Francesca Aras
Biomedical Engineer
 
Kids Opera�ng Room
86 Kingsway East
Dundee
DD4 8SL
 
DD: +44 (0) 7741 322242

 

     

 
Kids Opera�ng Room Limited is a registered charity in Scotland (SC048523) at 4th Floor, 107 George Street, Edinburgh, EH2 3ES  
 
Disclaimer
This message is intended only for the use of the person(s) ("Intended Recipient") to whom it is addressed. It may contain informa�on which is privileged and confiden�al. Accordingly any
dissemina�on, distribu�on, copying or other use of this message or any of its content by any person other than the Intended Recipient may cons�tute a breach of civil or criminal law and is
strictly prohibited. If you are not the Intended Recipient, please contact the sender as soon as possible.

 

From: Ryan Swaine
Sent: 28 July 2020 14:01
Subject: Re: Tek Ox

 

Hi Francesca

 

It was nice to speak to you, thank you for your enquiry.

 

Please send me your VAT exemption certificate and I will forward you a proforma invoice with our account details.

 

I have attached a picture of the T piece that I intend to supply. After I put the phone down, I thought about another option; we can supply you with an O2 concentrator adapter, I
have also attached a picture of this. Please let me know which adapter/T Piece you would prefer?

 

I look forward to your response and please let me know if you have any questions.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 27 Jul 2020 at 15:55, Francesca <Francesca@kidsor.org> wrote:

Dear Vandargraph team,

We’re looking to purchase a  Tek Ox oxygen analyser.  Would you be able to provide a VAT-free invoice? We are a registered charity and can provide a VAT exemption
certificate.

 

Could you advise if these are in stock and what your approximate delivery times are?

 

Many thanks,

 

Francesca Aras
Biomedical Engineer
 
Kids Opera�ng Room
86 Kingsway East
Dundee
DD4 8SL
 
DD: +44 (0) 7741 322242

 

     

 
Kids Opera�ng Room Limited is a registered charity in Scotland (SC048523) at 4th Floor, 107 George Street, Edinburgh, EH2 3ES  
 
Disclaimer
This message is intended only for the use of the person(s) ("Intended Recipient") to whom it is addressed. It may contain informa�on which is privileged and confiden�al. Accordingly any
dissemina�on, distribu�on, copying or other use of this message or any of its content by any person other than the Intended Recipient may cons�tute a breach of civil or criminal law and is
strictly prohibited. If you are not the Intended Recipient, please contact the sender as soon as possible.
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