22/07/2020 Gmail - Fwd: sensor

M Gmaill Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
Fwd: sensor

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 21 July 2020 at 18:08

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Please put an order on, thank you

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Divecrew <info@divecrew.co.uk>

Date: Tue, 21 Jul 2020 at 17:14

Subject: RE: sensor

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Yes please ryan . If you can sort that out for me and send me the invoice.
Many thanks

Sue
Kind regards

Sue Coffey- Co-Owner.

Divecrew. Brookers Corner. Bracknell Road. Crowthorne. RG45 6ST Tel: 01344 731113
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 21 July 2020 14:07

To: Divecrew <info@divecrew.co.uk>

Subject: Re: sensor

Hi Sue

Yes, it is definitely the R-33DE you require, is it just one you need?
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 21 Jul 2020 at 13:52, Divecrew <info@divecrew.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Ryan
| think this is the new one, but can you confirm and may | place an order please for it.

Many thanks
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Sue

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 20 July 2020 17:11

To: Divecrew <info@divecrew.co.uk>

Subject: Re: sensor

Dear Sue

Thank you for your email.

| am happy to confirm that we do supply the sensors for the O2EII.

| would like to confirm which sensor you require, as there are two versions of the Analox O2EIl analyser.

Most of the O2EII require the R-33DE, only a small number of the original O2EIl uses the R-22DEM (more than 12
years old). The R-22DEM has two wires with a 2 pole connector, whereas the R-33DE has no wires; it has a small
connector attached directly to the top of the PCB. | have attached a leaflet with pictures of both sensor types,
please can you confirm which you require?

Both sensors have a trade price of £35 each EXW, | have attached our trade price list.

| look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 17 Jul 2020 at 15:59, Divecrew <info@divecrew.co.uk> wrote:

Hi

| have a client that needs a new sensor in an Analox 02 E11
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Is this something you do, and could | order one please for Berkshire Dive Centre. | believe we have an account
with you.

Kind regards,

Sue Coffey

Head Office: Crowthorne - Tel: 01344 771 113, Web: www.Divecrew.co.uk
Address: Brookers Corner, Bracknell Road, Crowthorne, Berkshire. RG45 6ST.
Other Locations: Guildford

Address: Guildford Spectrum, Parkway, Guildford, Surrey. GU1 1UP.
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CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This document is strictly confidential and is intended only for use by the addressee. Any disclosure, copying,
distribution or other action taken in reliance of the information contained in this e-mail is strictly prohibited. Any views expressed by the sender of
this message are not necessarily those of the companies. If you have received this transmission in error, please use the reply function to tell us
and then permanently delete what you have received. It is also your responsibility to Virus check messages. Divecrew. The UK's Only PADI 5 Star
and Gold Star IDC Centre. Brookers Corner. Bracknell Road. Crowthorne. Berkshire. RG45 6ST. Telephone: 01344 771113.

y the addressee. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or other action taken in reliance of the information contained in this e-mail is strictly
prohibited. Any views expressed by the sender of this message are not necessarily those of the companies. If you have received this
transmission in error, please use the reply function to tell us and then permanently delete what you have received. It is also your responsibility to
Virus check messages. Divecrew. The UK's Only PADI 5 Star and Gold Star IDC Centre. Brookers Corner. Bracknell Road. Crowthorne. Berkshire.
RG45 6ST. Telephone: 01344 771113.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=154df707 36 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1672847118902787929&simpl=msg-f%3A16728471...

4/4


http://www.divecrew.co.uk/
http://www.divecrew.co.uk/
http://www.deptherapy.co.uk/
https://www.linkedin.com/profile/view?id=174586563&trk=nav_responsive_tab_profile
http://www.facebook.com/pages/Bracknell-United-Kingdom/Divecrew/68030696794
https://www.google.co.uk/webhp?sourceid=chrome-instant&ion=1&espv=2&ie=UTF-8#q=divecrew&lrd=0x487680a86941223f:0x91a04a696fe6f32a,1,

