
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Send to France ?
1 message

lepajolecgilles@gmail.com <lepajolecgilles@gmail.com> 9 July 2020 at 15:39
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Yes, OK, I’d like to proceed.

Best regards

Gilles Le Pajolec

 

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Ryan Swaine
Envoyé : jeudi 9 juillet 2020 11:56
À : Gilles LE PAJOLEC <lepajolecgilles@gmail.com>
Objet : Re: Send to France ?

 

Dear Gilles

 

The total price with postage and VAT would be GBP £60.

 

Do you need our account details? If you are happy to proceed, we can send you a proforma invoice with our account details and the total costs.

 

I will await your reply.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Thu, 9 Jul 2020 at 10:36, <lepajolecgilles@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan

I can send the paiement by  Paysend.

Are you OK to send the sensor when you’ll get the money (45£)?

Best regards

Gilles Le Pajolec

58 bd des américains 44300 Nantes - FRANCE

+33 6 22 56 42 27
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De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Ryan Swaine
Envoyé : lundi 6 juillet 2020 12:12
À : Gilles LE PAJOLEC <lepajolecgilles@gmail.com>
Objet : Re: Send to France ?

 

Dear Gilles

 

Thank you for your email.

 

We would be happy to send you a sensor to France, we will send it by Airmail.

 

Unfortunately our website is only in GBP and we only have a GBP bank account.

 

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Sun, 5 Jul 2020 at 16:51, Gilles LE PAJOLEC <lepajolecgilles@gmail.com> wrote:

Hello,

I'd like to buy a sensor (oxygen sensor - 0110224 - R-33DE Oxygen sensor for an Analox O2EII with JST connector)

Can you send it to france if I buy it on your website?

Can i Buy it in Euros?

Thanks for your answer

Best regards

 

Gilles Le Pajolec 

58 bld des Américains 44300 Nantes

(club de plongée "Les Bull'eau nantais)
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