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Fwd: Oxygen Sensors
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Gail

Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

9 July 2020 at 10:05

Please add their account (trade) and put a proforma on for 3x R-17VAN. Please add a note to let them know when
they arrive into stock, so we can send the proforma and request payment.

Thank you

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

-- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ok Club Diving Center <info@okclubthai.com>

Date: Thu, 9 Jul 2020 at 05:22

Subject: Re: Oxygen Sensors

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hey there

Andre Longchamps

OK club diving center
660/1 moo2 saladan, Koh Lanta , krabi Thailand 81150

Thai number +66943868915
What's app +33622585482

E-mail you have already
| need 3 for the moment :)
Kind regards

Sent from Yandex.Mail for mobile

08.07.2020, 20:40, "Ryan Swaine" <office@viamed.co.uk>:

Hi Andre

Please send me your details and | will put you in our system to inform once stock is available, do you

know how many you need (there are no minimum order requirements)?
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 8 Jul 2020 at 14:34, Ok Club Diving Center <info@okclubthai.com> wrote:
Hey Ryan
No worries please let me know when you receive them lam not in a hurry
Thanks for your time
Kind regards

Sent from Yandex.Mail for mobile

08.07.2020, 20:25, "Ryan Swaine" <office@viamed.co.uk>:

Dear Andre
Thank you for your email.
The trade price for the R-17VAN is GBP £35 each EXW.

With regards to new R-17VAN sensors, we are unfortunately out of stock. O2 sensor
production has been prioritised towards medical sensors and so our stock of scuba
sensors has been delayed.

Unfortunately we do not have any confirmed date as to when they will be available, but
it is likely to be a good few weeks or even a month or two before we have more R-
17VAN available.

Please let us know if you would still like to order them.
In order to send you the proforma invoice, | will need your complete delivery / invoice
address.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Sat, 4 Jul 2020 at 07:12, Ok Club Diving Center <info@okclubthai.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan
| need 3 please
Send to Thailand please .
| have a dive shop yes | wanna build something if it works | will use it for the dive
shop.
It is for an experiment project 1st

Sent from Yandex.Mail for mobile
30.06.2020, 18:22, "Ryan Swaine" <office@viamed.co.uk>:
Hi Andre

| would suggest we quote you through our sister company Vandagraph,
as they specialise in sensors for gas analysers in the scuba industry.

We can offer you the R-17VAN which is comparable to the R-17MED.
Before we quote, please can you let me know where we would be
sending the sensor, is the sensor for a scuba club, business or

personal use and how many sensors do you require?

| look forward to your reply.
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Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Sun, 28 Jun 2020 at 07:24, Ok Club Diving Center
<info@okclubthai.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan

Thanks for your reply

| completely understand priorities :)

Through those times it is good that taking care first from those who

need

lam interested in R17

Part number 0110017

I am on a project of gas analyser

Kind regards

Andre

WhatsApp number

+33622585472

Sent from Yandex.Mail for mobile

25.06.2020, 15:55, "Ryan Swaine" <office@viamed.co.uk>:

Dear Andre

Thank you very much for your enquiry via our website,
| apologise for the delay in getting back you, as it has
been very busy.

We are currently prioritising certain sensors for use in
the ventilator projects for the treatment of Covid-19.
Please can you let me know more about your
requirements?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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