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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: add items
1 message

bmg.equipment <bmg.equipment@gmail.com> 9 July 2020 at 07:52
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

good morning.

can you please revice this p.i.?

the quantity is 6 items.we had a cancell from a client.

Thanks in advance

Catherine

Στις 8/7/2020 3:40 μ.μ., ο Kate Griffiths έγραψε:

Good afternoon,

Please could I ask if you are happy for the attached proforma invoice to become an order?  If so, we
can ensure your stock is allocated to you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin
staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will
not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to
operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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On Thu, 25 Jun 2020 at 09:49, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Catherine,

Thank you for your order, please accept my reply on behalf of Sarah.
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Please see attached proforma invoice.  The warehouse has confirmed that the 10 x 0110045 can be
shipped with your previous order.  As you will see, this proforma invoice has no carriage charge on it.

This sensor is not currently in stock, I am not able to give you an accurate lead time at the moment.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin
staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office
will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to
continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.
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On Thu, 25 Jun 2020 at 08:49, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: bmg.equipment <bmg.equipment@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, 25 Jun 2020 at 08:48
Subject: add items
To: <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sara,

good day.

can you please add to our outstanding order the following:

viamed oxygen sensor R-45V   X   10TEM    (Compatible to:Puritan Bennett 
760 Puritan Bennett 840)

Send us p.i.so we can make payment.(one delivery all outstanding orders)

best regards

Catherine
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