07/07/2020 Gmail - Fwd: Request for Quotation

M Gma“ Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Request for Quotation
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 7 July 2020 at 11:39
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: ALOKH <lab@omanmed.com>

Date: Tue, 7 Jul 2020 at 10:02

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Cc: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,
kindly find below details
SHIP TO ADDRESS

Oman Medical Supplies and Services Co. LLC
Building No.90, Behind Ramez Shopping Center,
Wadi Al Lawami Street, Al Khoudh, Sultanate of Oman
Ph :00968 98865619

00968 24422655

Dear Sir,

Please send Performa Invoice with Shipping charge
Dear Alokh

Thank you for your email.

MAX-250E - 0110429 = USD $69 each EXW

| am pleased to inform you that we have them available from stock. Please let me know if you have any
questions.

If you would like to proceed with an order, please let me know your complete delivery/invoice address.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
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Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 7 Jul 2020 at 06:59, ALOKH <lab@omanmed.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Please Send Quotation for Below Mentioned Item

1.Viamed's Compatible for Newport Medical Instruments SEN2103P
Oxygen sensor..... 4 nos

Part number 0110429

Product name : MAX-250E Oxygen Sensor
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BIOMEDICAL ENGINEER

OMAN MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND SERVICES CO.LLC
MOBILE NO:-+968 98083788
www.omanmed.com

ALOKH T.A

BIOMEDICAL ENGINEER

OMAN MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND SERVICES CO.LLC
MOBILE NO:-+968 98083788
www.omanmed.com

ALOKH T.A

BIOMEDICAL ENGINEER

OMAN MEDICAL SUPPLIES AND SERVICES CO.LLC
MOBILE NO:-+968 98083788
www.omanmed.com

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=97 ca69e8f6 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1671554262666805365%7Cmsg-f%3A1671554262... 2/2


mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:lab@omanmed.com
http://www.omanmed.com/
http://www.omanmed.com/
http://www.omanmed.com/

