02/07/2020 Gmail - Fwd: sales info discounts / invioce

M Gmaill Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
Fwd: sales info discounts / invioce

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 1 July 2020 at 16:17

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Post Post Post <post@maskinogdykkerservice.no>
Date: Wed, 1 Jul 2020 at 15:13

Subject: sales info discounts / invioce

To: sales@vandagraph.co.uk <sales@vandagraph.co.uk>

Good Afternoon

| am in the prosses of placing an order for 4 02 sensors

| wish to receive your invoice either per e-mail or preferably by EHF

| have created an account with my Vat nr. 955874390 (to be used towards EHF)

to send the invoice by Email use: 854923069477080@voucher.24sevenoffice.com
this delivers direct to accounting

| think i am registered in your system earlier, please update the info.

i wish to order
leach 0110224 R-33DE Oxygen Sensor
3each 0110232 R-22VAN Oxygen Sensor

Have a nice day

deliver to

Maskin og DykkerService
Molland 35

4887 Grimstad

Norway

customs import nr. 30316042
Vat nr./ org.nr. 955874390

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=154df707 36 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1671028214675689363&simpl=msg-f%3A1671028...
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