26/06/2020 Gmail - RE: V1000 symulator

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: V1000 symulator

1 message

tukasz Chlebowski <l.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl> 26 June 2020 at 09:30
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

Yes you can.

We need 1 pcs.

Kind Regards

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Thursday, June 25, 2020 3:24 PM

To: Lukasz Chlebowski <I.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl>

Subject: Re: V1000 symulator

Good afternoon Lucasz,
Thank you for your email.

| am pleased to say that we are now in a position to manufacture the V1000. The price is €485 EXW. Please let me
know if you require a proforma invoice or any further assistance.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but
emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as
best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 25 Jun 2020 at 14:13, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: tukasz Chlebowski <|.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl>
Date: Thu, 25 Jun 2020 at 14:07

Subject: RE: V1000 symulator

To: <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

RESEND

From: tukasz Chlebowski <l.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl>

Sent: Wednesday, June 17, 2020 10:01 AM

To: 'p.radziejewski@euromed.net.pl' <p.radziejewski@euromed.net.pl>
Subject: RE: V1000 symulator

Dear Kate,

Is this product Fetal hear simulator V1000 is available?
Kind Regards

tukasz Chlebowski
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Wednesday, April 29, 2020 4:20 PM

To: Lukasz Chlebowski <l.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl>

Subject: Re: V1000

Good afternoon Lukasz,

Thank you for your enquiry.

Unfortunately, we are unable to give a timescale for the production of this item as we being asked to prioritise
medical sensors by governmental departments.

We plan to continue some time in the future, but can give no definite lead time for now.

I am sorry | have been unable to assist you on this occasion.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but
emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers
as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Apr 29, 2020 at 3:13 PM Ltukasz Chlebowski <l.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Could you prepare for me an offer for 1 pcs V1000 fetal heart simulator for CTG ?
Is this product is available at the moment?

Kind Regads

t ukasz Chlebowski

From: tukasz Chlebowski <l.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl>
Sent: Tuesday, August 06, 2019 6:30 PM

To: 'kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk' <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: 'zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk' <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: RE: V1000

Dear Kate,

Please see payment of proforma in attachment.

Please let me know when shipment will arrive.

Kind Regards

tukasz Chlebowski

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Giriffiths
Sent: Friday, August 02, 2019 2:25 PM

To: Lukasz Chlebowski <l.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl>

Cc: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Subject: Re: V1000

Good afternoon Lucasz,
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Please find attached proforma invoice as requested.

| have answered your questions as below:

Is this product delivered in some case (box)?

How much warranty you can give for this product?

Do you have some service in Poland?
own expense for calibration.

V1000 symulator

The V1000 has its own packaging.

The warranty is 12 months from date of invoice.

No, you would need to return the item to us at your

Does this product has some housing(plastic box) for a transport?  The items will be packaged securely in a

box.

The lead time for this item will be approximately one week after receipt of payment.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email

by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be

taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, Aug 2, 2019 at 9:26 AM tukasz Chlebowski <I.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl> wrote:

Dear Kate ,

| decided to buy it.

Please prepare for me proforma invoice for a 2 pcs V1000.

| have some more question does this product is delivered in some case (box) ?
How much warranty you can give for this product?

Do you have some service in Poland?

Does this product has some housing(plastic box) for a transport?

Please see below information about commpany to make a invoice:

Name: Euromed Medical Solution Sp. z 0.0. Sp.k
Address: ul. Szczesna 2, 60-587 Poznan, Poland
NIP: 781-17-57-396

Adress for a delivery is diffrent:
Name: Euromed Medical Solution Sp. z 0.0. Sp.k

Address: ul. Gwiazdzista 39b , 60-149 Poznan, Poland

Kind Regards

tukasz Chlebowski

Z powazaniem,

Inz. ds. serwisu

tukasz Chlebowski

Tel: 504 078 773

W przypadku dodatkowych pytan prosze o kontakt z biurem:

61843 90 59
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EUROMED))))

Euromed Medical Solution Sp. z .0, Spk ul. Gwnazdrisia 39 B, 60-149 Paznan
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Friday, August 02, 2019 9:58 AM

To: |.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl

Cc: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Subject: Re: V1000

Good morning tukasz,

Thank you for your email, please accept my reply on behalf of Zoey.

We ship this item from the UK. This item has a lead time/production time of approximately one week.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, Aug 2, 2019 at 8:49 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: tukasz Chlebowski <|.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl>
Date: Fri, 2 Aug 2019 at 08:44

Subject: RE: V1000

To: <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Zoey,

Thank you for a quick response.
Could you let me know do you send this product from UK to Europe or you send it from Korea or China?
| would like to know how much time we will wait for a delivery.

Kind Regards

tukasz Chlebowski

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Zoey Teal
Sent: Thursday, August 01, 2019 5:47 PM

To: |.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl

Subject: V1000

Dear Lukasz,

Thank you for your email.

We can offer a discounted price for two devices. The price would be €485.00 each.

This product does not have a certificate of measure but it is calibrated against a known calibration device.
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If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note my working hours are Monday to Thursday, 8am - 6pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

From: tukasz Chlebowski <|.chlebowski@euromed.net.pl>
Date: Thu, 1 Aug 2019 at 16:08

Subject: V1000

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>
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Hello,

I’'m interested of buying Fetal simulator model: V1000
Part number 1410000
Product name: V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator

GTIN / EAN13 5051826001936.

Is this product is available at the moment?

Does the simulator have a certificate from the office of measures that confirms the correctness of
indications which is accepted in the EU?

Can | count on discount prices by buying two items?

Kind Regards

tukasz Chlebowski

Z powazaniem,
Inz. ds. serwisu
tukasz Chlebowski

Tel: 504 078 773

W przypadku dodatkowych pytan prosze o kontakt z biurem:

61843 90 59

EUROMED ‘j)

Euromed Medical Solution Sp. £ .o, Spk ul. Genazdanisia 39 B, 60-149 Paznan

ul. Szczesna 2, 60-58T Poznan tel. 61 B43 64 34,61 84390 59 euromed@euwromed, newpl
NIP 781 17 57 396 fax 61 221 57 &8 wiwew euromed net pl
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INFORMACJA O PRZETWARZANIU DANYCH OSOBOWYCH
Kto jest odpowiedzialny za przetwarzanie Paristwa danych osobowych?

Administratorem Paristwa danych osobowych bedzie Euromed Medical Solution spétka z ograniczong odpowiedzialnosciq
sp.k. z siedzibq w Poznaniu (dalej: my). Jako administrator dbamy o to by przekazywane nam dane osobowe byty
bezpieczne. Mozna sie z nami skontaktowa¢ listownie na adres: ul. Gwiazdzista 39B, 60-149 Poznan, przez e-mail:
euromed@euromed.net.pl.
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W jakim celu i na jakiej podstawie przetwarzamy Paristwa dane osobowe?
Bedziemy przetwarza¢ Paristwa dane osobowe w celu:

e rozpatrzenia zgloszenia serwisu, kontaktowania sie z Paristwem w sprawach z tym zwiqzanych - podstawq
przetwarzania jest podjecie dziatan na Paristwa Zqdanie przed zawarciem umowy,

e zawarcia oraz wykonania umowy o swiadczenia ustugi serwisowej, rozpatrywania zgtoszenn gwarancyjnych -
podstawq przetwarzania Paristwa danych osobowych jest wykonanie umowy,

e windykacji naleznosci, ustalenia, obrony i dochodzenia roszczen, przechowywania danych w celach
archiwizacyjnych, a takze mozliwosci wykazania przez nas, ze Paristwa dane przetwarzamy zgodnie z przepisami
prawa oraz marketingu bezposredniego oferowanych przez nas produktow i ustug — w tym zakresie podstawq
przetwarzania jest nasz prawnie uzasadniony interes.

W pozostatym zakresie Paristwa dane sq przetwarzane na podstawie udzielonej przez Paristwa zgody.

Komu przekazujemy Paristwa dane osobowe?

Bedziemy przekazywac Paristwa dane osobowe podmiotom uczestniczqcym w wykonywaniu przez nas czynnosci, tj.
podmiotom swiadczqcym ustugi ksiegowe, podmiotom swiadczqcym ustugi audytorskie, podmiotom swiadczgcym ustugi
w zakresie dostarczania i utrzymania systemow oraz urzqdzen informatycznych, na ktorych pracujemy (IT), podmiotom
Swiadczqcym ustugi hostingowe, kurierom.

Czy Parnistwa dane bedq przekazywane do panstwa trzeciego lub organizacji miedzynarodowej?

W przypadku dokonywania napraw Paristwa dane osobowe bedq przekazywane do producenta tego sprzetu. W zwigzku z
tym, Panstwa dane osobowe mogq zostac przekazane poza Europejski Obszar Gospodarczy (EOG). W takich przypadkach
oswiadczamy, Ze podobny poziom ochrony Panstwa danych w paristwie trzecim jest zapewniony poprzez wprowadzenie
jednego z zabezpieczen okreslonych w art. 44 -47 RODO. W ramach realizacji Paristwa praw zapewniamy Panstwu
réwniez mozliwos¢ uzyskania kopii odpowiednich srodkéw zabezpieczajgcych dane osobowe w przypadku takiego
transferu.

Jak dtugo bedziemy przechowywaé Paristwa dane osobowe?

Bedziemy przechowywaé Paristwa dane osobowe przez okres niezbedny do realizacji celow, dla ktérych zostaty zebrane.
W przypadku danych zawartych w dokumentach, w szczegdlnosci fakturach, zwiqzanych z rozliczeniem podatkéw - do
czasu uptywu przedawnienia zobowiqzania podatkowego. W przypadku danych pobranych w zwiqgzku z wykonaniem
umowy maksymalnie do czasu wygasniecia Panistwa roszczen zwiqzanych z jej wykonaniem.

Jakie majq Paristwo prawa zwiqzane z przetwarzaniem Paristwa danych osobowych?

Majq Paristwo prawo dostepu do swoich danych w kazdej chwili. Ponadto, mogq Paristwo Zqda¢ sprostowania, usuniecia,
przenoszenia danych osobowych a takze ograniczenia ich przetwarzania.

W przypadku, gdy wyrazili Paristwo zgode na przetwarzanie danych osobowych, mogq Paristwo jq cofng¢ w kazdym
czasie. Wycofanie zgody nie ma wplywu na zgodnos¢ z prawem przetwarzania, ktérego dokonano na podstawie
udzielonej zgody przed jej wycofaniem.

Przystuguje Panstwu takze prawo wniesienia skargi do Prezesa Urzedu Ochrony Danych Osobowych.

Kiedy mogq Paristwo wnies¢ sprzeciw wobec przetwarzania danych osobowych?

W sytuacji, gdy podstawq przetwarzania Panistwa danych jest nasz prawnie uzasadniony interes, przystuguje Panstwu
prawo do wniesienia sprzeciwu wobec przetwarzania Parnstwa danych osobowych - z przyczyn zwiqzanych z Parnstwa
szczegdlng sytuacjq.

Dodatkowo, w przypadku gdy Paristwa dane bedziemy przetwarza¢ na potrzeby marketingu bezposredniego, réwniez
majq Panstwo prawo w dowolnym momencie wnies¢ sprzeciw wobec takiego przetwarzania, w tym profilowania, jezeli
jest ono zwiqzane z takim marketingiem bezposrednim.

Czy podanie przez Paristwa danych jest obowigzkowe?

Podanie przez Paristwa danych osobowych w zgtoszeniu serwisowym jest dobrowolne. Konsekwencjq ich niepodania jest
brak mozliwosci rozpatrzenia zgtoszenia. Podanie danych umieszczonych na fakturze VAT jest obowigzkowe.
Konsekwencjq ich niepodania jest brak mozliwosci wystawienia faktury VAT

Czy decyzje wzgledem Paristwa sq podejmowane w sposéb zautomatyzowany?
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Dane osobowe nie bedq przetwarzane w sposéb opierajqgcy sie wytqcznie na zautomatyzowanym przetwarzaniu, w tym
profilowaniu.

Wiadomos¢ ta jest przeznaczona jedynie dla osoby lub podmiotu bedgcego jej adresatem i moze zawiera¢
poufne lub uprzywilejowane informacje. Zakazane jest przeglgdanie, przesytanie, rozpowszechnianie lub inne
wykorzystywanie tych informacji, jak rowniez podejmowanie dziatan na ich podstawie, przez osoby lub podmioty
inne niz zamierzony adresat. Jezeli otrzymali Panstwo te wiadomos$¢ przez pomytke prosimy o poinformowanie
nadawcy i usunigcie jej z komputera.

The information transmitted is intended only for the person entity to which it is addressed and may contain
confidential privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action
in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you
received this in error, please notify the sender and delete the material from your computer.
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