26/06/2020 Gmail - Re: Request for Quotation

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Request for Quotation
1 message

SBA KALIBRASI <sbakalibrasi@gmail.com> 26 June 2020 at 05:46
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,
Thanks for the information about calibration

Please kindly look after the attachment for our purchase order
and Reissue your former invoice

Best Regards,
Tiono

Pada tanggal Jum, 19 Jun 2020 pukul 15.54 Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> menulis:
Good morning Tiono,

Thank you for your email, please accept my reply on behalf of Zoey.

The output beats per minute is governed by the firmware and the micro controller - there is no adjustable calibration
control.

If required the unit can be returned to Viamed for its accuracy to be checked and a Certificate of Calibration can be
issued.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.
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26/06/2020 Gmail - Re: Request for Quotation

On Fri, 19 Jun 2020 at 09:38, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: SBA KALIBRASI <sbakalibrasi@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, 19 Jun 2020 at 09:31

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation

To: <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Zoey,

| wanna ask something regarding foetal heart simulator
If we need to recalibrate the product, what i need to do?
any suggestions?

About the offer, we will send formal purchase order soon

Best regards,
Tiono

Pada tanggal Sel, 16 Jun 2020 pukul 13.58 Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> menulis:
Dear Tiono,

Thank you for your reply.

Proforma invoices are only valid on our system for 30 days but we will be in touch before the 30 days are up.
If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails
will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as best we
can.
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Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, Jun 16, 2020 at 4:19 AM SBA KALIBRASI <sbakalibrasi@gmail.com> wrote:
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Gmail - Re: Request for Quotation

Dear Zoey,

Thank for your reply.

| had forward your offer to our finance division but still no further action though
We will inform you as soon as possible after further notice is done

Best Regards,

Tiono

Pada tanggal Sen, 15 Jun 2020 pukul 14.29 Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> menulis:

Dear Tiono,

Please accept my reply as Kate is on annual leave today.

| have attached you proforma to this email.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

From: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Wed, 10 Jun 2020 at 08:45

Subject: Re: Request for Quotation

To: SBA KALIBRASI <sbakalibrasi@gmail.com>
Good morning Tiono,

A calibration certificate is supplied with each new V1000.

Many thanks.
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26/06/2020

Gmail - Re: Request for Quotation

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin
staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will
not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to

operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Jun 10, 2020 at 6:32 AM SBA KALIBRASI <sbakalibrasi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Glad to hear that you all are doing well
About your product, is there any calibration certificate?

Below is our address

PT. Suria Berkat Abadi

JI. Gunung Sahari Raya No. 78

Kelurahan Gunung Sahari Selatan

Kecamatan Kemayoran

Central Jakarta. 10610

Best Regards,

Tiono

Pada tanggal Sel, 9 Jun 2020 pukul 21.32 Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> menulis:
Good afternoon Tiono,
Thank you for your email, we are all well, | hope you are too.
The prices are as follows:
V1000 - 1410000 $595 each (production time 2-3 weeks approximately)
UltraMaxO2 Oxygen Analyzer - 0111265 $467.50 each (currently in stock)
Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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Gmail - Re: Request for Quotation

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main
office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to
continue to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

From: SBA KALIBRASI <sbakalibrasi@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, 9 Jun 2020 at 10:33

Subject: Request for Quotation

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Catrin,

| hope you and your company are doing well during this pandemi
We are looking for price for this following items

1. V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator
2. UltraMaxO2 Oxygen Analyzer

We were bought your V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator at 2018
The product is great and working really well.

If the price is right, we hope to buy maybe 3 more of each
(so please give your best price :) )

Please stay safe and healthy during this difficult time

Best Regards,
Tiono

PO PT SBA.pdf

504K
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