
24/06/2020 Gmail - Re: Order

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1670219962760357171%7Cmsg-f%3A1670311023… 1/2

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Order
1 message

Sport Sub <info@sportsub.it> 23 June 2020 at 18:18
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan,

sorry for the delay, please keep the R-41V on back order and ship R-33DE because I have a customer that wait for it.

Waiting instructions for the payment.

Thanks
Regards

"Ai sensi del D. Lgs n.196/2003 si precisa che le informazioni contenute in questo messaggio sono riservate e ad uso esclusivo del destinatario. Qualora il messaggio le
fosse pervenuto per errore, La preghiamo di eliminarlo senza copiarlo e di non inoltrarlo a terzi, dandocene gentilmente comunicazione."

Il giorno 22 giu 2020, alle ore 21:24, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> ha scritto:

Hi Simone

Please accept my reply on Jean's behalf.

Thank you very much for your order. Unfortunately we do not have any R-41V sensors available, as
they are being used in the medical industry to help with the pandemic. It is unlikely that we will have any
R-41V sensors within the next 3 months. 

Do you want to keep the R-41V on back order or would you prefer to cancel it?

Do you want us to ship the R-33DE straight away?

I will await your reply.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 22 Jun 2020 at 18:11, Sport Sub <info@sportsub.it> wrote:
Good afternoon Jean,

in 2018 we place an order for some oxygen sensors, I need to place a new order for the following
sensors if possible:

N° 1    0110224 R-33DE Oxygen Sensor
N° 2    0110041 R-41V Oxygen Sensor

You should have our company information (Company name: Sport Sub Viareggio) but in case you
need something let me know.
Waiting for your quotation included shipping cost to Italy.

Thanks
Best Regards
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