19/06/2020 Gmail - RE: Order 363 Tracking RS459535960GB

M Gma“ Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Order 363 Tracking RS459535960GB

1 message

Info 4Divers <info@4divers.nl> 19 June 2020 at 11:15

To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

Please send:

4x R-22VAN (there should be Molex connector included)

Thanks in advance,

Kind regards,

Linda

4DIVERS Veenendaal

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Ryan Swaine
Verzonden: woensdag 17 juni 2020 15:01

Aan: Info 4Divers <info@4divers.nl>

CC: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Onderwerp: Re: Order 363 Tracking RS459535960GB

Hi Linda

Your order has been dispatched.

We would be happy to supply you with the R-22VAN for the Divesoft analyser.

R-22VAN = GBP £35 each EXW

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 17 Jun 2020 at 12:58, Info 4Divers <info@4divers.nl> wrote:

Hi Gail,

Hope you are fine, the order was already dispatched means: it was send yesterday?

Today we got a question for an oxygen sensor for a Divesoft Analyzer

It is a R22 sensor

Do you have a replacement sensor for this type of analyzer?

Looking forward to your reply,

Kind regards,

Linda

ADIVERS Veenendaal

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Gail Bell
Verzonden: dinsdag 16 juni 2020 14:38

Aan: Info 4Divers <info@4divers.nl>

Onderwerp: Order 363 Tracking RS459535960GB
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Dear Lex Schotema,
| am writing to inform you that your order, 363 has been dispatched.

You can track your order reference 363 on the , with the following tracking number RS459535960GB.

Please see attached delivery note, DAN124181-1 and a copy of your invoice, RAN124181-1.

Kind Regards

Gail Bell
Vandagraph Ltd
gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
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