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M Gmaill Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: FW: KE25 order

1 message
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 19 June 2020 at 11:04
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, Kate Giriffitths
<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Please can we process this order, we will also need to add a declaration on the box, | can provide this once Cathy
has it invoiced.

Thank you

Ryan

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: WQL MED Kft. <wgl@t-online.hu>

Date: Fri, 19 Jun 2020 at 10:57

Subject: RE: FW: KE25 order

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>
Cc: WQL Med KFT. <wgl@t-online.hu>

Kind Regards:

Betti Seredi dr.

managing director
waQL MED Ltd.

Szeged, Hungary

+36 62 552 225

H~

S
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From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Thursday, June 18, 2020 11:02 AM

To: WQL MED Kft.

Subject: Re: FW: KE25
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Hi Betti

Yes, we have these sensors, but not the silicone case.

The sensor is the KE-25F1 (part no. 0110529) = EUR €93.15 each EXW. These sensors are not available from stock,
delivery time is typically 2-4 weeks.

If the shape of the sensors is not important, then you may also use the standard KE-25 (part no. 0110524) = EUR €45
each EXW. These sensors are available from stock.

Please find attached our brochure which includes the range of KE sensors.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 18 Jun 2020 at 08:03, WQL MED Kft. <wgl@t-online.hu> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

One of our customers is looking for the attached O2 sensor. This type is unknown for me. Originally it was in a
silicone case.

Do you have it?

Betti

Kind Regards:

Betti Seredi dr.

managing director
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WQL MED Ltd.

Szeged, Hungary
+36 62 552 225
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