
Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: Viamed - R-26MED Oxygen Sensor
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Jun 17, 2020 at 9:51 AM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com>
Cc: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Mr. Khanh

Thank you, my colleague Zoey will be in contact with you PI.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Wed, 17 Jun 2020 at 07:26, Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

We want to order 6pcs of R-42V oxysensor.
Pls send us PI include shipping cost.
Delivery address as last order.
Thank you.

Vào Thứ Ba, 16 tháng 6, 2020, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> đã viết:
Dear Mr Kanh

We have some stock available, how many would you need?

R-23V - 0110023 = USD $43.75 each EXW

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Tue, 16 Jun 2020 at 11:09, Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
Thanks for your quotation, 
How about R-23V Oxygen Sensor ? Is it available in your stock?

Vào Th 3, 16 thg 6, 2020 vào lúc 15:57 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> đã viết:
Dear Mr Khanh

Thank you.

The R-42V = USD $40.00 each EXW

The problem with the R-42V is that we have very few in stock (approx 10x) and we are unlikely to be able to get anymore for another 3 months.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Tue, 16 Jun 2020 at 09:08, Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,
Please give me quotation of R-42V oxysensor. Thanks and looking forward to hearing from you soon

Vào 16:57, T.5, 11 Th6, 2020 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> đã viết:
Dear Mr Kanh
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We do not have one, but I can obtain them. There is a cost of approximately $110 and they normally take a week to arrive, although it could be longer
depending on whether the issuing office is back at work after the lockdown.

Please let me know if you would like me to organise one for you.
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