16/06/2020 Gmail - Fwd: P/O Number: E 330001975

M Gmaill Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: P/O Number: E 330001975

1 message

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Tue, Jun 16, 2020 at 3:52 PM
To: Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: MOORE, Christopher (SHERWOOD FOREST HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST)
<christopher.moore5@nhs.net>

Date: Tue, 16 Jun 2020 at 15:50

Subject: RE: P/O Number: E 330001975

To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Cc: HERBERT, Pedro (SHERWOOD FOREST HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <pedro.herbert@nhs.net>

Dear Kate,

Please take this email as authorisation to proceed with PO.

Kind regards

Chris Moore MSc
Principal Technician

Medical Equipment Management Department (MEMD)
Sherwood Forest Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust

Telephone 01623 622515 extension 3801

Efficient and Safe
We will be consistent and do the right thing at the right time,

first time.
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From: HERBERT, Pedro (SHERWOOD FOREST HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST)
Sent: 16 June 2020 15:47

To: MOORE, Christopher (SHERWOOD FOREST HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST)
Subject: FW: P/O Number: E 330001975

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 16 June 2020 12:19

To: Memd (SHERWOOD FOREST HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST); HERBERT, Pedro (SHERWOOD FOREST
HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST)

Subject: Re: P/O Number: E 330001975

Good afternoon,

Thank you for your purchase order.

Please could | advise you that the price of item 0110417 - Oxygen sensor MAX-17 is £72 each when purchasing
two. The other price breaks are as follows:

1=£280.00 [ 2=£72.00 [l 3=£68.00 [l 11=£64.00

This is a non-stock item, so the lead time may be 2-3 weeks, it is very difficult at this present moment to give accurate
lead times.

Please let me know if you would like us to proceed with your order at the price above.

All prices are excluding VAT and carriage is free for medical oxygen sensors.

Many thanks.

On Tue, Jun 16, 2020 at 12:01 PM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Memd (SHERWOOD FOREST HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST) <sfh-trmemd@nhs.net>
Date: Tue, 16 Jun 2020 at 11:57

Subject: P/O Number: E 330001975

To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@yviamed.co.uk>

Cc: HERBERT, Pedro (SHERWOOD FOREST HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST)
<pedro.herbert@nhs.net>

FAO ORDERS
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Please acknowledge the order.

Please remember to quote the W or E prefix on the order
number, to avoid delaying payment of your Invoice.

Chris Moore MSc
Principal Technician

Medical Equipment Management Department (MEMD)
Sherwood Forest Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust
Telephone 01623 622515 extension 3801
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@, 5 Efficient and Safe

We will be consistent and do the right thing at the right time,
first time.
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This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended
recipient please inform the
sender that you have received the message in error before deleting it.

Please do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any

action in relation to its contents. To do so is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful. Thank you for your co-operation.

NHSmail is the secure email and directory service available for all NHS staff in
England and Scotland. NHSmail is approved for exchanging patient data and other
sensitive information with NHSmail and other accredited email services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch, https://portal.nhs.net/help/
joiningnhsmail
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This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the intended
recipient please inform the

sender that you have received the message in error before deleting it.

Please do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take any
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action in relation to its contents. To do so is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful. Thank you for your co-operation.

NHSmail is the secure email and directory service available for all NHS staff in
England and Scotland. NHSmail is approved for exchanging patient data and other

sensitive information with NHSmail and other accredited email services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch, https:/portal.nhs.net/help/joiningnhsmail
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