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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oxygen Sensor Order
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 June 2020 at 15:18
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Tauchdiscounter <info@tauchdiscounter.de>
Date: Tue, 16 Jun 2020, 12:54
Subject: Re: Oxygen Sensor Order
To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

could you please send me

5x R-22AT

2x R-33DE

Thank you.

---
Mit freundlichen Grüßen,

Christian Rose
Tauchdiscounter
Am Bienenstock 19
45327 Essen
Tel. 0201-7587731
Fax. 0201-7587732
Mail: info@tauchdiscounter.de
Web www.tauchdiscounter.de

Am 20.09.2019 15:57, schrieb Ryan Swaine:

Hi Christian
 
Thanks again for your order. Your sensors were dispatched on the 16th by Airmail, unfortunately there is no
tracking number with the standard airmail service.
 
Please have a great weekend,
 
Ryan
 

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 

On Fri, 20 Sep 2019 at 14:37, Tauchdiscounter <info@tauchdiscounter.de> wrote:
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Hi Ryan,

do you have a tracking number for me?

---
Mit freundlichen Grüßen,

Christian Rose
Tauchdiscounter
Am Bienenstock 19
45327 Essen
Tel. 0201-7587731
Fax. 0201-7587732
Mail: info@tauchdiscounter.de
Web www.tauchdiscounter.de

Am 17.09.2019 10:34, schrieb Ryan Swaine:

Hi Christian
 
It appears that we must of done, as my colleagues have processed your order.
 
Thank you,
 
Ryan
 

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 

On Tue, 17 Sep 2019 at 08:10, Tauchdiscounter <info@tauchdiscounter.de> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

thank you, i am fine.

Did you received the new credit card details yesterday?

---
Mit freundlichen Grüßen,

Christian Rose
Tauchdiscounter
Am Bienenstock 19
45327 Essen
Tel. 0201-7587731
Fax. 0201-7587732
Mail: info@tauchdiscounter.de
Web www.tauchdiscounter.de

Am 16.09.2019 11:12, schrieb Ryan Swaine:

Hi Christian
 
Thank you very much, I hope you are well.
 
We keep Viamed and Vandagraph separate. Should I give you a call for your new card details?
 
Best regards
 
Ryan
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Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 

On Mon, 16 Sep 2019 at 07:40, Tauchdiscounter <info@tauchdiscounter.de> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

could you please send me

5x R-22AT

2x R-33DE

I think you need a new credit card info from me.

Or can you join my accounts at Vandagraph and Viamed (Sauerstoffsensoren.de) and use the
payment information together?
---

Mit freundlichen Grüßen,

Christian Rose
Tauchdiscounter
Am Bienenstock 19
45327 Essen
Tel. 0201-7587731
Fax. 0201-7587732
Mail: info@tauchdiscounter.de
Web www.tauchdiscounter.de

Am 27.04.2018 15:52, schrieb Ryan Swaine:

Hi Christian
 
I suspect they are old details as it was not authorised. Should I give you call for new details?
 
Best regards
 
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 

On 27 April 2018 at 14:46, Tauchdiscounter <info@tauchdiscounter.de> wrote:

Yes, you can use it.

---
Mit freundlichen Grüßen, 
 
Christian Rose 
Tauchdiscounter 
Am Bienenstock 19 
45327 Essen 
Tel. 0201-7587731 
Fax. 0201-7587732 
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Mail: info@tauchdiscounter.de 
Web www.tauchdiscounter.de

Am 27.04.2018 15:08, schrieb Ryan Swaine:

Hi Christian
 
The cc details we have expires in 07/20, are we okay to use them?
 
Best regards
 
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 

On 27 April 2018 at 13:58, Tauchdiscounter <info@tauchdiscounter.de> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

thank you for the information.

Is there still a valid credit card i my account?

---
Mit freundlichen Grüßen, 
 
Christian Rose 
Tauchdiscounter 
Am Bienenstock 19 
45327 Essen 
Tel. 0201-7587731 
Fax. 0201-7587732 
Mail: info@tauchdiscounter.de 
Web www.tauchdiscounter.de

Am 27.04.2018 12:55, schrieb Ryan Swaine:

Dear Christian
 
Thank you for your order. I can confirm the trade price is still £35 each. I
have attached a copy of our latest price list and sensor leaflet.
 
Best regards
 
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
 

On 27 April 2018 at 08:59, Tauchdiscounter <info@tauchdiscounter.de>
wrote:

Dear Jean,

could you please send me
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5x R-22AT

3x R-17VAN

Is the actual trade price still 35 GBP each?

---
Mit freundlichen Grüßen, 

Christian Rose 
Tauchdiscounter 
Am Bienenstock 19 
45327 Essen 
Tel. 0201-7587731 
Fax. 0201-7587732 
Mail: info@tauchdiscounter.de 
Web www.tauchdiscounter.de
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