™M Gmail

Fwd: Viamed - R-26MED Oxygen Sensor

2 messages

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com>

Date: Thu, 4 Jun 2020 at 13:16

Subject: Re: Viamed - R-26MED Oxygen Sensor

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>, <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com>

Dear Ryan,

Here is our delivery and invoice address:
AN AN IMPORT EXPORT CO.,LTD

Address: 497/123/14 Thong Nhat street, Ward 16, Go Vap District, Ho Chi Minh City, Vietnam.

Attn: Thai Phuong
Mobile: +84 987 546 072
Email: trinhphuong2606@gmail.com; phukienthaythe@gmail.com

Thank you & BRs,
Khanh Thanh

Vao Th 5, 4 thg 6, 2020 vao lic 18:45 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> d viét:
Dear Mr. Khanh Thanh

Thank you again for your enquiries.

Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Thu, Jun 4, 2020 at 2:34 PM

We have the sensors available from stock, please can you send me your complete delivery and invoice address and we will send you a proforma invoice. As soon as

payment is received, we will arrange dispatch.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
On Thu, 4 Jun 2020 at 12:36, Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

You have offered me MAX-250E - 0110429 = USD $69.00 each EXW.

Now we want to order 12pcs to test this time. After that, | will order more quantity, over 100pcs.
Is goods ready now? Could you offer us shipping charge and transit time also? We want to ship by express service.

Thank you & BRs,
Khanh Thanh

Vao Th 2, 27 thg 4, 2020 vao lic 18:23 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Dear Mr Khanh

| would expect you are going to be looking at up to 6 weeks.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 11:00, Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
Thanks for your reply.
Because we is manufacture ventilator, if order about 500 pcs and 1000 pcs. Please give me time to finished.
Thanks and looking forward to hearing from you.

Best regards
Khanh Thanh

Vao Th 2, 27 thg 4, 2020 véo lic 16:42 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Dear Mr. Khanh

Yes, but things are changing all of the time.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 10:34, Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
You mean is 250 pcs in your stock?. is it right?.

Best Regards.
Khanh Thanh

Vao Th 2, 27 thg 4, 2020 v&o ldc 16:30 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Dear Mr. Khanh

| could probably spare 250.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 10:25, Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
Please help me check quantity in your stock.Thanks

Vao 16:23, T.2, 27 Th4, 2020 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Hi Mr. Khanh

We carry some stock of the MAX-250E, how many were you looking for?

MAX-250E - 0110429 = USD $69.00 each EXW

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 10:15, Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
Thanks for your quotation,

Do you have sensor compatible with maxtec Max 250E?

Vao Th 4, 22 thg 4, 2020 vao lic 20:27 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Dear Mr. Khanh

| apologise for the delay in my reply.
The R-17MED - part no. 0110017 = USD $34.50 each EXW
Because of the huge demand, orders are being placed against production, as we receive payment.

Best regards
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Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 20 Apr 2020 at 13:50, Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
We need very urgent with number larger oxy sensor (500-700 pcs) sensor, Please help me check price and type of sensor with number larger in
in your stock.
Thanks and looking forward to your reply soon.

Best regards!!!
Khanh Thanh

An An Production trading import and Export company Limited
Phone number: +84964136690

Vao Th 6, 17 thg 4, 2020 vao luc 16:33 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Dear Khanh Thanh

Thank you very much for your enquiry via our website.

We have a small stock of R-26MED and we can have more manufactured, but this could take while. Is the size of the sensor important?
We have regular supplies of the R-17MED, which is the same output specification as the R-26MED, but has a larger body diameter.

| have attached the specifications for both sensors.

I will await your reply.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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An An Production trading import and Export company Limited.
Add: : 497 Thong Nhat Street, Ward 16 - Go Vap District - HCMC — Viet Nam
Phone: +84 0964136690

An An Production trading import and Export company Limited.
Add: : 497 Thong Nhat Street, Ward 16 - Go Vap District - HCMC — Viet Nam
Phone: +84 0964136690

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Mr Khanh <phukienthaythe@gmail.com>
Cc: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Mr Khanh

Thank you very much. My colleague Zoey will be in contact this afternoon with your proforma invoice.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

[Quoted text hidden]

Thu, Jun 4, 2020 at 2:37 PM
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