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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: Sensor Enquiry
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 3 June 2020 at 16:10
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Proforma please

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: João Rosário <joao.rosario@pinguimsub.pt>
Date: Wed, 3 Jun 2020 at 15:59
Subject: Re: Sensor Enquiry
To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Dear Ryan

Thank you .

Only today we got feed back from our client.

We would like to order  

1 x MAX 250E  +  Airmail Tacked & Signed Service which would cost GBP £11. As you recommended.

Send us details for payment please as ex works 

Invoice  and delivery

Pinguim Sub Lda

Urbanização da Raminha Lote 1 

8500-579 portimão portugal

VAt N. PT503 017 876 

Best regards

João Rosário

Pinguim Sub Lda
Urbanização da Raminha Lote 1
8500-579 Portimão 
Telf: + 351 282 485 784

Telf. + 351 917 209 235  (whattsApp)
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E-mail: joao.rosario@pinguimsub.pt
 www.pinguimsub.pt 

Às 09:53 de 20/05/2020, Ryan Swaine escreveu:

Dear João

We are all very well, thank you. I hope you are too.

Although we are on a partial shut down to our warehouse, we are still processing orders, please note
that there may be a couple of day delay in dispatch.

I am pleased to inform you that we have the MAX-250E available from stock.

MAX-250E = GBP £52 each EXW

With disruptions to the delivery services, I would suggest we send it by Airmail Tacked & Signed Service
which would cost GBP £11.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 20 May 2020 at 09:43, João Rosário <joao.rosario@pinguimsub.pt> wrote:

Dear Ryan

First of all, I hope that everyone is in good health in this very complicated period of pandemic that we
are experiencing.

I would like to ask if they are working and if they have a Max -250E cell

OEM Sensor Part No. R125P03-002 available for delivery & price to us , please.

Best Regards

João Rosário 

HQ for Agachon Sub  & Pinguim Sub  

Instructor Trainer #663  IANTD
IANTD Instructor # 7553 CCR / OC & CCR/ Normoxic / Trimix / Trimix Gas Blender / Essen�als

IANTD B.O.A
Instructor IT CCR EVOLUTION /INSPIRATION /VISION

Instructor IT CCR Liberty

Instructor CCR Megalodon 
PADI IDC Staff Instructor # 952739

PSI-PCI Inspector # 26035
OFFERING PADI / IANTD TRAINING!
Marine Salvage Team – Commercial Diver

Sea – Help 
Diving Consultant
Pinguim Sub Lda
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Urb. da Raminha Lote 1
8500-579 Por�mão – Portugal

Office Tel.+ 351 282 485 784

Salvage , Diving &  Sea Help Base ( next to Sail Club Por�mão) 00 351 282 492 256
24 hours emergency call out Salvage Team : + 351 917 209 235 (whatsApp)  & + 351 91 991 28 29
E-mail: joao.rosario@pinguimsub.pt
www.pinguimsub.pt

"Quality means doing it right when no one is looking”
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