M Gma" Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order 383 from Cardiotec Medical Limited

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Fri, May 29, 2020 at 1:38 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Please can we treat this order as urgent. Please note the delivery address.
Thank you
Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Cardiotec Medical Limited <amanda@cardiotec.ie>
Date: Fri, 29 May 2020, 13:34

Subject: Order 383 from Cardiotec Medical Limited

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Your order number 383 for €32.00 -

PLEASE CAN YOU SHIP THIS DIRECTLY TO OUR CUSTOMER AS MATTER OF URGENCY. THEY ARE
INTESTERED IN PUTTING IT INTO A VENTILATOR (and might lead to significant orders). PLEASE DO NOT
INCLUDE ANY INVOICE IN DELIVERY BOX.

DELIVERY ADDRESS:
John Delaney
Montbretia

Grange Bective

Navan

Co. Meath

C15 YE81

Please find attached a PDF Copy of your order:

Regards
Amanda Richardson

ﬂ PurchaseOrder_383.pdf
56K
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