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M Gmail Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

PURCHASE ORDER N. 9999/5763 (FW: REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (FW: LCT
CSJV PWRA+V - Encomenda Células Analisadores de 02))

2 messages

Joaquim Lopes Arranhado <jarranhado@sacyr.com> 21 May 2020 at 16:27

To: "gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk" <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Cc: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>, Antonio Alexandre Araujo Leite
<aleite@sacyr.com>, Antonio Sebastiao Oliveira Sanches Tavares <ATavares@cvc.cv>, Manuel Jorge Gomes Caldas
<mcaldas@sacyr.com>

Hello Gail / Ryan

Please find attached the PO no. 9999/5763, related to Proforma MAN123987 (see attached files).

Please send the sensors to the following address:

Arnaud Logis

ATT Mr. Dhaval Ramesh
Estrada Militar,

Bairro do Grilo - Fetais
2680-183 Camarate
PORTUGAL

T +351 219 489 215

Please send me a copy of the commercial invoice, packing list and tracking number to my email
jarranhado@sacyr.com asap.

The original (in paper) of the commercial invoice should be sent by mail to our main office in Lisbon, Portugal, as
follows:

CYES SOMAGUE - CONSTRUCAO DO TERMINAL DE LOME, A.C.E.
Rua Castilho, n° 165

1° Piso, sala ACE

1070-050 Lisboa

PORTUGAL

We will make the money transfer as soon as possible.
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Looking forward to hear from you soon, best regards,

Joaquim Lopes Arranhado

cves K=

__ Snmugue__

CYES-SOMAGUE JV

LCT — Lomé Container Terminal

ROND POINT DU PORT

Immeuble LCT, 3°™M€ étage
BP 6299

LOME TOGO

Mob TG: (+228) 97 17 1972
Mob PT: (+351) 917 677 107

jarranhado@sacyr.com

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em Nome De Ryan Swaine

Enviada: quinta-feira, 21 de maio de 2020 14:45

Para: Joaquim Lopes Arranhado <jarranhado@sacyr.com>

Assunto: Re: REQUEST FOR QUOTATION (FW: LCT CSJV PWRA+V - Encomenda Células Analisadores de O2)

Dear Joaquim

I am very well, thank you. | hope you are too.

Thank you very much for your enquiry. Please find your proforma invoice attached, please check the address details
and let me know if you require any amendments.

I have added transport by Airmail, but if you would prefer UPS, we can do this for GBP £21 (additional £7).

I look forward to your response and please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
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http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 21 May 2020 at 13:35, Joaquim Lopes Arranhado <jarranhado@sacyr.com> wrote:

Good afternoon Ryan

Hope you are doing well.

Please send us a quotation regarding the items and quantities described below:

- 0110217 Oxygen Sensor R-17VAN 103133 — G9 (Replacement Sensor for Vandagraph VN202)
...................... 6 units

- 0110237 Oxygen Sensor R-17S1 739695 — E6
................................................................................................................ 2 units

We are already clients of Vandagraph, so please find attached our previous PO 9999/5298 in order you can
remember the details about Cyes Somague ACE.

The only modification | would like to introduce is the delivery address, so follows the new one:

Arnaud Logis

ATT Mr. Dhaval Ramesh
Estrada Militar,

Bairro do Grilo - Fetais
2680-183 Camarate
PORTUGAL

T +351 219 489 215

Looking forward to hear from you soon, best regards,

Joaquim Lopes Arranhado
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cyes =,

Somague

CYES-SOMAGUE JV

LCT — Lomé Container Terminal

ROND POINT DU PORT

Immeuble LCT, 3¢™M€ étage
BP 6299

LOME TOGO

Mob TG: (+228) 97 17 19 72
Mob PT: (+351) 917 677 107

jarranhado@sacyr.com

De: Manuel Jorge Gomes Caldas <mcaldas@sacyr.com>

Enviada: quinta-feira, 21 de maio de 2020 10:44

Para: Joaquim Lopes Arranhado <jarranhado@sacyr.com>

Cc: Jorge Carmo Marques <jmarques@sacyr.com>; Antonio Alexandre Araujo Leite <aleite@sacyr.com>;
j_oliveira57 @hotmail.com

Assunto: LCT CSJV PWRA+V - Encomenda Células Analisadores de O2

Bom dia Joaquim Arranhado,

Por favor encomendar os seguintes consumiveis a Vandagraph:

¢ Célula analisador (para os dois analisadores portateis e para o Problender da Nardi) — 6 un;

e T E—

¢ Célula analisador (Membrana) — 2 un.
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e ——

Atenciosamente,

Manuel Caldas
Engenheiro Civil | Civil Engineer

PWRA - LCT — Lomé Container Terminal - Togo

SaCYrsomague

ENGENHARIA E
INFRAESTRUTURAS

Tel. +351 219 104 000
Tim. +351 912 393 690 (WhatsApp)
TIm. +228 96 803 117

mcaldas@sacyr.com

Sacyr Somague, S.A. | Alvara N.° 20496 - PUB
Rua Castilho N.° 165, 1.° Piso

1070-050 Lisboa - Portugal

www.sacyr.com_www.somague.pt

@@ @ () @ @) [seovrie

(PT) AVISO DE CONFIDENCIALIDADE Esta mensagem e seus anexos constituem informagao confidencial e/ou privilegiada para uso exclusivo do respetivo

destinatario, ndo podendo o conteudo da mesma ser alterado. Se néo for o destinatario ou a pessoa autorizada a receber esta mensagem, ndo pode usar,
copiar ou divulgar as informagdes nela contidas ou tomar qualquer agdo baseada nessas informacdes. Se recebeu esta mensagem por engano avise por favor
o respetivo remetente, respondendo ao e-mail e em seguida elimine de imediato a mensagem e seus anexos.
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Se a informagao contida nesta mensagem contiver dados de natureza pessoal, o seu destinatario encontra-se obrigado a assumir um compromisso sério de

sigilo a fim de garantir a privacidade dessa mesma informag&o. A informag&o s6 podera ser utilizada, Unica e exclusivamente, no @mbito do processo que

justificou o seu envio, serd mantida apenas enquanto se mantiver o fim a que se destina, apds o que tera que ser eliminada, encontrando-se garantido o direito

de acesso a essa mesma informacéao por parte do titular dos dados, por contacto direto com o respetivo remetente, respondendo ao e-mail.

2 attachments

-E Cyes - Proforma MAN123987.pdf
79K

b Purchase Order n° 9999-5763 (VANDAGRAPH).pdf
46K

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Gail

28 May 2020 at 11:26

Please can you update Proforma MAN123987 and then once | have checked it, we can resend it to them.

Thank you

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

[Quoted text hidden]
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