26/05/2020 Gmail - Fwd: Order

M Gmaill Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
Fwd: Order

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 26 May 2020 at 10:06

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl>
Date: Sun, 24 May 2020 at 10:20

Subject: Re: Order

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Morning Ryan, hope you are well

Can you please send me :

3x R33s1

2x R33de

1xr17van

2x Tekox

Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards,

Eddy van Vliet - Scuba Support
Franciscusweg 10-1

1216SK Hilversum

Nu nog ruimere openingstijden!

Zie onze website voor meer informatie.

Phone: +31 648511848 Info@ScubaSupport.nl
Fax: +3184-8307700 www.ScubaSupport.nl
KvK:321167830000 VAT# NL001959467B52

Bank Account: Multicorp

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U

Op ma 23 mrt. 2020 17:53 schreef Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl>:
Thanks Ryan

Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards,

Eddy van Vliet - Scuba Support
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Franciscusweg 10-1

1216SK Hilversum

Nu nog ruimere openingstijden!

Zie onze website voor meer informatie.

Phone: +31 648511848 Info@ScubaSupport.nl
Fax: +3184-8307700 www.ScubaSupport.nl
KvK:321167830000 VAT# NL001959467B52

Bank Account: Multicorp

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U

Op ma 23 mrt. 2020 17:16 schreef Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>:
You too Eddy
Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 23 Mar 2020 at 16:12, Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl> wrote:
Stay safe Ryan!

Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards,
Eddy van Vliet - Scuba Support
Franciscusweg 10-1

1216SK Hilversum

Nu nog ruimere openingstijden!
Zie onze website voor meer informatie.

Phone: +31 356313499 Info@ScubaSupport.nl
Fax: +3184-8307700 www.ScubaSupport.nl
KvK:321167830000

VAT-ID# NL001959467B52

Bank Account: Multicorp

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U

Bent u tevreden over onze service, geef ons dan een review op Google?

Klik hier om een review te plaatsen

On Mon, 23 Mar 2020 at 17:12, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thanks Eddy

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 23 Mar 2020 at 16:10, Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl> wrote:

Yeah, here the same....real bizarre.
Yes, please add these 8pcs in addition.
Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards,
Eddy van Vliet - Scuba Support
Franciscusweg 10-1

1216SK Hilversum

Nu nog ruimere openingstijden!
Zie onze website voor meer informatie.

Phone: +31 356313499 Info@ScubaSupport.ni
Fax: +3184-8307700 www.ScubaSupport.nl
KvK:321167830000

VAT-ID# NL001959467B52

Bank Account: Multicorp

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U

Bent u tevreden over onze service, geef ons dan een review op Google?

Klik hier om een review te plaatsen

On Mon, 23 Mar 2020 at 17:06, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Eddy

Thank you very much.

Life is a little crazy at the moment. | hope all is well with you?

The Quick Ox are supplied with flow divertors, do you need an additional 8?
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 23 Mar 2020 at 15:09, Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl> wrote:

Hey Ryan,
How is life for you now?

8pcs 9711002 Flow diverter for oxygen sensor
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8pcs 9730210 Quick-ox
2 pcs R33DE
2 pcs R17VAN

1pc R22VAN

Hope you are well....

Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards,

Eddy van Vliet - Scuba Support
Franciscusweg 10-1
1216SK Hilversum

Nu nog ruimere openingstijden!
Zie onze website voor meer informatie.

Phone: +31 356313499 Info@ScubaSupport.nl
Fax: +3184-8307700 www.ScubaSupport.nl
KvK:321167830000

VAT-ID# NL001959467B52

Bank Account: Multicorp

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U

Bent u tevreden over onze service, geef ons dan een review op Google?

Klik hier om een review te plaatsen
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