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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: R-22AV order ref. account 00020096
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Mon, May 18, 2020 at 4:30 PM
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Maria Hewitt <maria-hewitt@btconnect.com>
Date: Mon, 18 May 2020 at 16:06
Subject: R-22AV order ref. account 00020096
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Good a�ernoon.

Please can you supply ;

10 x R-22AV oxygen sensors to ;

EuroTec equipment services,
Chequer House
Bronington
SY13 2JQ

no boxes required as previous orders 

many thanks
Maria
EuroTecTel. 01948 780546
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