07/05/2020 Gmail - RE: Request for quote

M Gma“ Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Request for quote

1 message
support@europaelec.com <support@europaelec.com> Thu, May 7, 2020 at 9:29 AM
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate

Thanks for the reply

5000 individual unit around 850 packs . PI find below invoice and delivery address

We are looking for EX Stock or short lead time . Kindly advise best delivery . We can accept partial gty on stock basis
Awaiting your valuable response

EUROPA ELECTRONICS LIMITED
132 Waverley Crescent

West Lothian

Livingston EH54 8JR

United Kingdom
support@europaelec.com
www.europaelec.com

Tel : +44 - 2070787597

Company Reg Number SC 528804

Rgds
Sumit

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Thursday, 7 May, 2020 4:23 PM

To: support@europaelec.com

Subject: Re: Request for quote

Good morning,

Thank you for your enquiry.
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07/05/2020 Gmail - RE: Request for quote

Please could | ask you to clarify if you mean 5000 packs or individual units?

Part number 4310003, Spirotrue H is sold in packs of six. Each pack of six costs £60.

In order for me me to send you a quotation, | would need your invoice and delivery addresses in order to set up a new
account.

| await your reply.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but
emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as
best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, May 7, 2020 at 8:20 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Thu, 7 May 2020 at 08:05

Subject: Fwd: Request for quote

To: Steve Hardaker <steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>

Can someone please contact the customer and provide a quotation.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: bluepoint MEDICAL Info <info@bluepoint-medical.com>
Date: Thu, 7 May 2020 at 07:40

Subject: WG: Request for quote

To: steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Steve,

| hope you are fine.

Please be so kind and get in contact.

Best regards,

Dana

Mit freundlichen GrifRen

ppa. Dana Lindner

bluepoint medical GmbH & Co. KG
An der Trave 15

23923 Selmsdorf

phone: +49 (0) 38823 / 5488-10

fax: +49 (0) 38823 / 5488-29

e-mail: d.lindner@bluepoint-medical.com

web: http://www.bluepoint-medical.com
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Trade register: Schwerin, Reg.-No.: HRA2600

Von: support@europaelec.com [mailto:support@europaelec.com]
Gesendet: Donnerstag, 7. Mai 2020 05:24

An: bluepoint MEDICAL Info

Betreff: Request for quote

Hi
Kindly quote for below

SpiroTrue H Bluepoint medical

https://www.bluepoint-medical.com/en/medical/sensors/flow/spirotrue_h
Qty : 5000

Regards

Sumit

(&EUROPA

bluepoint MEDICAL

GmbH & Co. KG

An der Trave 15

23923 Selmsdorf

Germany

Fon +49-(0)-38823-5488-0
Fax +49-(0)-38823-5488-29
info@bluepoint-medical.com

Steve
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Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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