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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Oxygen sensor, R-17MED
1 message

Mike Kharoufeh <mike@mtc-ps.com> 6 May 2020 at 11:29
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
Cc: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sarah,

Could you please send us offer for the below :

 

0110017 Oxygen sensor, R-17MED (Qty:3)

 

Please men�on your best delivery �me.

 

Best Regards

 

Eng. Mike Kharoufeh
Sales Engineer

Modern Technology Company
P.O.Box 156
Beit Sahour
Palestine

Mobile: +970569037891

Tel:+970-2-2772017
Fax:+970-2-2772016

Web: www.mtc-ps.com

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Zoey Teal
Sent: Monday, September 02, 2019 3:20 PM
To: Mike Kharoufeh
Cc: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
Subject: RFQ EyeMax

 

Dear Mike, 

tel:+970-2-2772017
http://www.mtc-ps.com/
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
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Please find your invoice attached. 

 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Zoey Teal

 

Please note my working hours are Monday to Thursday, 8am - 6pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

From: Mike Kharoufeh <mike@mtc-ps.com>
Date: Mon, 26 Aug 2019 at 07:49
Subject: RE: RFQ. EyeMax
To: <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>
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Dear Sarah,

·        Please find the a�ached bank SWIFT.

 

·        Please let us know when you will ship our order .

 

·        Send us copy of the invoice before shipping.

 

·        Please write the following on your invoice:

The exporter of the products covered by this document  (customs
authorization No …)

declares that ,except where otherwise clearly indicated, these products
are of EEC

preferential  origin.

 

 
The part marked in red regards only to Authorized Exporter .

 

The invoice has to be original one and must bear the signer name and
signature.

 

 

Best Regards

 

Eng. Mike Kharoufeh 
Sales Engineer

Modern Technology Company
P.O.Box 156
Beit Sahour
Palestine

Mobile: +970569037891
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Tel:+970-2-2772017
Fax:+970-2-2772016

Web: www.mtc-ps.com

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: Friday, August 23, 2019 11:07 AM
To: Mike Kharoufeh
Subject: Re: RFQ. EyeMax

 

Dear Mike,

 

We sent you a proforma invoice last month.  Please can you advise if this is still required or would you like me to
delete from our system?

 

I have attached a copy for your reference.

 

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 2 Aug 2019 at 13:19, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Mike,

 

We sent you a proforma invoice last month.  Please can you advise if this is still required or would you like me to
delete from our system?

 

I have attached a copy for your reference.

 

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 17 Jul 2019 at 10:15, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Mike,

 

Thank you for your email.

 

Please find attached a proforma invoice, PRO05624.

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 17 Jul 2019 at 07:20, Mike Kharoufeh <mike@mtc-ps.com> wrote:

Dear Sarah,

Could you please renew the a�ached offer include the shipping cost:

 

Please make the Qty as the following :

Green – 10

Blue – 40

Orange – 40

 

Best Regards

 

Eng. Mike Kharoufeh 
Sales Engineer

Modern Technology Company
P.O.Box 156
Beit Sahour
Palestine

Mobile: +970569037891

Tel:+970-2-2772017
Fax:+970-2-2772016

Web: www.mtc-ps.com

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: Thursday, January 10, 2019 5:34 PM
To: Mike Kharoufeh
Subject: Re: RFQ. EyeMax

 

Dear Mike,

 

mailto:mike@mtc-ps.com
tel:+970-2-2772017
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We sent you a proforma invoice, PRO05299 last month.  Please can you advise if this is still required, or
would you like me to delete from our system?

 

I have attached a copy for your reference.

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 12 Dec 2018 at 11:42, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Mike,

 

Thank you for your email.
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Please find attached a proforma invoice, PRO05299.

 

Please be advised that we are unable to offer any further discounts due to having small margins.

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 12 Dec 2018 at 08:56, Mike Kharoufeh <mike@mtc-ps.com> wrote:

Dear Sarah,
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Could you please send us your best offer for the following includes the
shipping cost to Tel Aviv Airport:

Description of Products Part Qty

EyeMax™2 Phototherapy Mask – Regular. 
Model: R300P01 - Color code: Blue
Occipital – frontal circumference 32-38cm. Pack of 20.

1114005 50

EyeMax™2 Phototherapy Mask – Premie. 
Model: R300P02 Color code: Orange
Occipital – frontal circumference 26-32cm. Pack of 20.

1114006 50

Try to give us your better price to help us to close this order.
Best Regards

 

Eng. Mike Kharoufeh 
Sales Engineer

Modern Technology Company
P.O.Box 156
Beit Sahour
Palestine

Mobile: +970569037891

Tel:+970-2-2772017
Fax:+970-2-2772016

Web: www.mtc-ps.com

 

tel:+970-2-2772017
http://www.mtc-ps.com/

