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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Commande N°CF20-0399
1 message

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> 5 May 2020 at 15:46
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Achat | Sha Medical <achat@sha-medical.com>
Date: Tue, 5 May 2020 at 15:39
Subject: RE: Commande N°CF20-0399
To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Good afternoon,

 

You can proceed with this order.

Please, send it with the one we already have.

 

Cordialement,

Sandra COURBIS

 

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Sarah Walton
Envoyé : mardi 5 mai 2020 09:34
À : contact | Fullcare Group <contact@fullcare-group.net>
Objet : Re: Commande N°CF20-0399

 

Good morning,

 

Thank you for your purchase order, CF20-0399.

 

Please be advised that the unit price and part number is incorrect. PleaseF see below:

Part number 0012165 - Viamed Pulse Oximeter VM-2160 SmartSat

Unit price when purchasing 5 units - €285.00 EXW

 

We no longer supplier the standard version of the VM-2160, part number 0012160.
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I have placed your order on hold until you advise that you are happy to proceed with this order.

 

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note:  Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin Staff to work
from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but
emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as
best we can.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: contact | Fullcare Group <contact@fullcare-group.net>
Date: Mon, 4 May 2020 at 17:05
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Subject: Commande N°CF20-0399
To: VIAMED LTD (facturation) <info@viamed.co.uk>

 

Bonjour,
 
Veuillez trouver en pièce jointe notre Commande n°CF20-0399.
 
Restant à votre disposition pour tout renseignement complémentaire,
 
Cordialement,

mailto:info@viamed.co.uk

