
Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Fri, May 1, 2020 at 3:09 PM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Durston M.L. <m.l.durston@swansea.ac.uk>
Date: Fri, 1 May 2020 at 15:05
Subject: Order
To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Good afternoon,

 

I would like to order the following for Ventilator Project with Welsh Gov

·       1x T-7V OXYGEN SENSOR 0110058

 

Could you provide details how I can pay for the item using a credit card

 

Kind Regards / Cofion Gorau

 

Martyn

 

Front Of House Manager | Rheolwr Blaen Tŷ

Institute of Life Science 1 | Athrofa Gwyddor Bywyd 1

Swansea University Medical School | Ysgol Feddygaeth Prifysgol Abertawe

Phone | Ffôn 00 (44)1792 602697

Email | Ebost sumsreception@swansea.ac.uk  

Twitter | Facebook | YouTube  | Scribd

www.medicine.swansea.ac.uk
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Rhowch wybod i ni os hoffech dderbyn eich gohebiaeth yn Gymraeg. Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth yn
Gymraeg neu yn Saesneg. Ni fydd gohebu yn Gymraeg yn arwain at oedi. /

Let us know if you would like to receive correspondence in Welsh. We welcome correspondence in Welsh or
English. Corresponding in Welsh will not lead to a delay

 

pcreqsa_1_7774.PDF
4K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=d104de5290&view=att&th=171d0958012850ff&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=171d091d15df21210152&safe=1&zw

