
Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: MAX-250 Oxygen Sensor - 0110425
1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Apr 27, 2020 at 12:15 PM
Reply-To: steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Sophie

Please update the delivery address as per the email and no VAT.

Beijing YQH Network Technology Co., Ltd.
409, Building 1, Courtyard 6, Jin An West Road,
Beijing Tianzhu Free Trade Zone
Shunyi District
Beijing
China

On Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 11:15, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Steve - Proforma attached - please can you check it, as I am not sure if insurance should be worked out before
or after VAT is added - I did it before.

Also let me know if VAT needs to be removed - I can't tell if they're a charity so might be able to send us a VAT
exempt certificate?

Thanks

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3pm

Please note:  Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow office staff to work from home, and I am now working
remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue
to operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------

On Mon, Apr 27, 2020 at 10:55 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
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Address 27 Old Gloucester Street, London, WC1N 3AX Mobile  44 7427 895 896 

Email  ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org 

Website  http://www.graemattafoundation.org/ 

Address 27 Old Gloucester Street, London, WC1N 3AX Mobile  44 7427 895 896 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 10:48
Subject: Re: MAX-250 Oxygen Sensor - 0110425
To: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>

Please generate a proforma invoice based upon the following and send the copy to me:

1000  x 0110432  MAX-250(B) GBP £52.00 each

UPS shipping at £200

Plus insurance

On Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 10:40, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Steve- I have done this - account: CID14768

Please let me know if you need me to do anything else

Sophie 

On Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 08:50, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Please set up a sales account straight away. Need to send quotes this morning.

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ferron Gray <ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org>
Date: Sat, 25 Apr 2020 at 13:20
Subject: Re: MAX-250 Oxygen Sensor - 0110425
To: <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Steve,

Haven't received that quote yet?  Could you chase?

Thanks
Dr Ferron Gray
President at Grae Matta Foundation

Donate to the Foundation via Paypal Here

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named
recipient(s) only. If you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not
disclose the contents to anyone or make copies thereof.

On Fri, 24 Apr 2020 at 16:22, Ferron Gray <ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org> wrote:
Hi Steve,

Do you also stock the Max 17?

If you do, I can also order 1000 units of this additionally.

Thanks

Dr Ferron Gray
President at Grae Matta Foundation

https://www.google.com/maps/search/27+Old+Gloucester+Street,+London,+WC1N+3AX?entry=gmail&source=g
tel:44+7427+895+896
mailto:ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org
http://www.graemattafoundation.org/?utm_source=WiseStamp&utm_medium=email&utm_term=&utm_content=&utm_campaign=signature
https://www.google.com/maps/search/27+Old+Gloucester+Street,+London,+WC1N+3AX?entry=gmail&source=g
tel:44+7427+895+896
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org
mailto:steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk
http://facebook.com/graemattafound?utm_source=WiseStamp&utm_medium=email&utm_term=&utm_content=&utm_campaign=signature
http://linkedin.com/in/graemattafoundation?utm_source=WiseStamp&utm_medium=email&utm_term=&utm_content=&utm_campaign=signature
http://twitter.com/graemattafound?utm_source=WiseStamp&utm_medium=email&utm_term=&utm_content=&utm_campaign=signature
https://www.paypal.com/cgi-bin/webscr?cmd=_s-xclick&hosted_button_id=XBPVKZRYLQ4VE&source=url
mailto:ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org


Email  ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org 

Website  http://www.graemattafoundation.org/ 

Address 27 Old Gloucester Street, London, WC1N 3AX Mobile  44 7427 895 896 

Email  ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org 

Website  http://www.graemattafoundation.org/ 

Address 27 Old Gloucester Street, London, WC1N 3AX Mobile  44 7427 895 896 

Email  ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org 

Website  http://www.graemattafoundation.org/ 

Donate to the Foundation via Paypal Here

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named
recipient(s) only. If you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not
disclose the contents to anyone or make copies thereof.

On Fri, 24 Apr 2020 at 14:49, Ferron Gray <ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org> wrote:
Hi Steve,

The delivery address is the following:

Beijing YQH Network Technology Co., Ltd.
409, Building 1, Courtyard 6, Jin An West Road,
Beijing Tianzhu Free Trade Zone
Shunyi District
Beijing
China

Can you please put to together a quote with Freight Costs and Details

Thanks

Dr Ferron Gray
President at Grae Matta Foundation

Donate to the Foundation via Paypal Here

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named
recipient(s) only. If you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not
disclose the contents to anyone or make copies thereof.

On Fri, 24 Apr 2020 at 14:15, Ferron Gray <ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org> wrote:
Good Afternoon Steve,

Very strange as I haven't had any missed calls.

I just tried calling you now but it went unanswered.  I left you a voicemail asking to call me back when
you're available.

Kind Regards

Dr Ferron Gray
President at Grae Matta Foundation

Donate to the Foundation via Paypal Here

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named
recipient(s) only. If you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not
disclose the contents to anyone or make copies thereof.
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Address 27 Old Gloucester Street, London, WC1N 3AX Mobile  44 7427 895 896 

Email  ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org 

Website  http://www.graemattafoundation.org/ 

On Fri, 24 Apr 2020 at 14:05, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Dr Gray

I have tried phoning  several times in order to discuss your requirements, can you please phone me
on: 07850 252267

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ferron Gray <ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org>
Date: Thu, Apr 23, 2020 at 3:21 PM
Subject: Re: MAX-250 Oxygen Sensor - 0110425
To: <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Good Afternoon Zoey,

For the moment I need 1000 Units.  It may increase depending on what you have in stock.

Kind Regards
Dr Ferron Gray
President at Grae Matta Foundation

Donate to the Foundation via Paypal Here

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named
recipient(s) only. If you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not
disclose the contents to anyone or make copies thereof.

On Thu, 23 Apr 2020 at 14:25, Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon, 

Thank you for your email. 

Please can I ask the quantity you require?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note:  Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin
Staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will
not be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to
operate and serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
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Address 27 Old Gloucester Street, London, WC1N 3AX Mobile  44 7427 895 896 

Email  ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org 

Website  http://www.graemattafoundation.org/ 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

From: Ferron Gray <ferron.gray@graemattafoundation.org>
Date: Thu, 23 Apr 2020 at 12:46
Subject: MAX-250 Oxygen Sensor - 0110425
To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Hi There,

Do you have any of these in stock?  If so, what's the price?

Kind Regards

Dr Ferron Gray
President at Grae Matta Foundation

Donate to the Foundation via Paypal Here

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named
recipient(s) only. If you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not
disclose the contents to anyone or make copies thereof.

 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

.

-- 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542
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