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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

FW: cell for oxygen analyser
1 message

Ray Towey <raymond.towey@btinternet.com> 23 April 2020 at 08:42
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Paddy Boyle <office@africanmission.org.uk>, Carol Newman <c.newman@diamedica.co.uk>

Ryan hi, thanks for your help with the below sensor R-17VAN earlier this month.  It has reached the engineer who
needed it and he is very grateful. I wish to send another one. It’s not so urgent now but if it could go to the below
address, Diamedica, in a few days I would be most grateful. In short can you just repeat the order in the same way. I
will phone you this morning and make a Visa payment as I did before.

Thanks,

Ray Towey

 

From: Ray Towey <raymond.towey@btinternet.com> 
Sent: 01 April 2020 14:53
To: 'ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk' <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Subject: RE: cell for oxygen analyser

 

Ryan, thanks for your fast response. I wish to make a purchase today as it is urgent. I would like it to be sent by fast
courier to this address below. I attach a page from your web. I don’t not see the exact code, R-17VAN so I will phone
you so that you can clarify and I can then pay by my Visa over the phone.

Thanks,

Ray

Diamedica (UK) Ltd
Carol Newman

Grange Hill Industrial Estate
Bratton Fleming
Barnstaple
Devon, EX31 4UH
United Kingdom

Email: info@diamedica.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1598 710066
Fax: +44 (0)1598 710055

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 01 April 2020 14:18
To: raymond.towey@btinternet.com
Subject: Re: cell for oxygen analyser

 

Dear Dr. Ray Towey
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Thank you very much for your email. The sensor you require is the R-17VAN and we have them available from stock.

 

The total cost including postage would be £60. If you would like to proceed with an order, you can place your order on
our website using paypal or credit card.

 

Alternatively you can give me a call on my mobile number and I can take your details over the phone.

 

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

 

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

 

On Wed, 1 Apr 2020 at 14:08, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Ray Towey <raymond.towey@btinternet.com>
Date: Wed, 1 Apr 2020 at 13:57
Subject: cell for oxygen analyser
To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

 

Hi, can you help me with getting a cell for the attached oxygen analyser VN202 Mark II?

Thanks,

Dr.Ray Towey
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