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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Delivery note for checking
1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 April 2020 at 08:46
Reply-To: steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Please add T pieces to Narked at 90 order for 100 R-22MEDs

So, 1 x 0120402 @ £300.00

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: John Routley <john@narkedat90.com>
Date: Thu, 16 Apr 2020 at 08:06
Subject: Re: Delivery note for checking
To: <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>

Yes please Steve

Kind regards
John routley
Sent from my iToaster7

On 16 Apr 2020, at 7:29 am, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi John

Did you confirm whether you needed T pieces.

Steve

On Wed, 15 Apr 2020 at 18:33, John Routley <john@narkedat90.com> wrote:

Hello steve if the 100 sensors is ready tomorrow when Amish arrives you can give them to him to
bring back to me, if not ship them to me at the factory

 

 

Kind Regards, 
John Routley

J. ROUTLEY

Tel: +44(0)1933 681255

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Steve Nixon
Sent: 15 April 2020 18:04
To: John Routley <john@narkedat90.com>
Subject: Re: Delivery note for checking

mailto:john@narkedat90.com
mailto:steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:john@narkedat90.com
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:john@narkedat90.com


16/04/2020 Gmail - Fwd: Delivery note for checking

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=97ca69e8f6&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1664114426957468236%7Cmsg-f%3A1664114426… 2/3

 

Sounds good and thanks for the payments.

 

Let me know ASAP regarding the batch of 100.

 

 

Steve

 

On Wed, 15 Apr 2020 at 17:57, John Routley <john@narkedat90.com> wrote:

I think that’s fine Steve, Amish will be leaving around 8am to get cables and then on to you

 

 

Kind regards

John routley

Sent from my iToaster7

 

 

On 15 Apr 2020, at 5:52 pm, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi John

 

Will the attached suffice?

Goods will be ready for collection by Amish tomorrow morning, >10:00

 

 

--

Steve

 

 

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.

 

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

.
<DELIVERY NOTE Narked at 90 2020-04-15.pdf>

 

--

Steve

 

 

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.

 

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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-- 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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-- 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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