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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order : ES/PO/140420-viamed
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Apr 14, 2020 at 12:49 PM
To: Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: C M Hor <cmhor@emstecmedical.com>
Date: Tue, 14 Apr 2020 at 11:12
Subject: Order : ES/PO/140420-viamed
To: <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Winnie Loo (Emstec) <winnie.loo@emstecmedical.com>

Dear Sarah,

 

I would like to confirm order for the followings  :-

 

1.       Oxygen sensor R-30V                                     x  5 pcs

2.       Oxygen sensor R-17V                                     x  2 pc

 

 

I look forward to the proforma invoice as soon as possible.

 

Best regards

 

CM Hor

Emstec Services
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