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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Invoice and delivery details
1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 9 April 2020 at 14:42
Reply-To: steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Sorry Sarah 

Please see below.

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Mehul Doshi <mehul.doshi@cabinetoffice.gov.uk>
Date: Thu, 9 Apr 2020 at 14:33
Subject: Re: Invoice and delivery details
To: <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Steve 

Can you amend the invoice address to:

DHSC
A/C Payable
Quarry House
Quarry Hill
Leeds
West Yorkshire
LS2 7UE

Mehul Doshi
Part of NHS-DHSC Oxygen & Ventilator Programme
E: mehul.doshi@cabinetoffice.gov.uk  M: 07562438988
Follow us on Twitter @cabinetofficeuk

On Thu, 9 Apr 2020 at 14:18, Mehul Doshi <mehul.doshi@cabinetoffice.gov.uk> wrote:
Hi Steve

Please email me the invoice as soon as you can.

Mehul Doshi
c/o Dept of Health & Social Care
39 Victoria St 
Westminster
London 
SW1H 0EU

Delivery address for now:

Defence Fulfilment Centre 2,
Hortonwood 50,
Donnington,
Telford
TF1 7AE
United Kingdom

Is that ok?
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Mehul Doshi
Part of NHS-DHSC Oxygen & Ventilator Programme
E: mehul.doshi@cabinetoffice.gov.uk  M: 07562438988
Follow us on Twitter @cabinetofficeuk

-- 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
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