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M Gma“ Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Newport €360 Ventilator Oxygen sensor

1 message
Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com> Mon, Apr 6, 2020 at 1:06 PM
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate Griffiths ,
Okay,

Kind Regards,/ Met vriendelijke groet ,/ 5-3&t])ia&

Eric Okunde
o
SYrd,
M‘f @mmzd %&/]%dﬂ/ @@/
Boschdijk 600,

5624CB Eindhoven

The Netherlands

Tel: +31402938955

Email: info@queenscompanies.com

www.queenscompanies.com

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Kate Griffiths
Verzonden: maandag 6 april 2020 13:56

Aan: Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com>
Onderwerp: Re: Newport e360 Ventilator Oxygen sensor

Hi, Please do not pay yet, as | will have to amend the account and proforma invoice to show dollars. | will send you
another proforma invoice, in dollars, there would be a $25 bank charge also.

Thank you.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered, but
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emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our customers as
best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, Apr 6, 2020 at 12:53 PM Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com> wrote:
Dear Kate Giriffiths ,
Invoice address and delivery address should be the same
Haicom Optimum Electronics Ltd Nigeria,.
Att: Mrs Aghama Aigbe
6 Segun Sodiya Close, Thomass Estate, Lekki Ajah Lagos Nigeria
Tel:08036728811

Payment will be made right away

Kind Regards,/ Met vriendelijke groet ,/ 5-3&t]) a4z

Eric Okunde

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1663208451778638813%7Cmsg-f%3A16632248...  2/10


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:info@queenscompanies.com
https://www.google.com/maps/search/6+Segun+Sodiya+Close?entry=gmail&source=g
tel:08036728811

06/04/2020 Gmail - RE: Newport €360 Ventilator Oxygen sensor

LYrP, w %6
s Oheons @//y)d/fy Z
Boschdijk 600,

5624CB Eindhoven

The Netherlands

Tel: +31402938955

Email: info@queenscompanies.com

www.queenscompanies.com

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Kate Griffiths
Verzonden: maandag 6 april 2020 13:43

Aan: Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com>
Onderwerp: Re: Newport e360 Ventilator Oxygen sensor

Good afternoon Eric,

Please find attached proforma invoice as discussed. Does the delivery address need a company name included?

Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be answered,
but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and serve our
customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, Apr 6, 2020 at 11:40 AM Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com> wrote:

Dear Kate Griffiths ,

You don’t need the our European Vat number because the company buying Haicom Optimum Electronics Ltd)
is in Nigeria and you are shipping direct to Nigeria after payment,.

Queens company is sources for Haicom Optimum Electronics Ltd Nigeria,.

Queens company VAT number is NL823604755B01

Kind Regards,/ Met vriendelijke groet ,/ 5-3&t]) a4

Eric Okunde

SYry

m}; Q{é(fﬁﬂ()’ %{x/f%@/y @2/7/
Boschdijk 600,

5624CB Eindhoven

The Netherlands

Tel: +31402938955

Email: inffo@queenscompanies.com

Www.queenscompanies.com
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Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Kate Griffiths
Verzonden: maandag 6 april 2020 12:29

Aan: Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com>
Onderwerp: Re: Newport €360 Ventilator Oxygen sensor

Thank you, | will set up an account for you and email you a proforma invoice later today.

Please could | ask you for your VAT number?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be
answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and
serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Mon, Apr 6, 2020 at 11:24 AM Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com> wrote:
Dear Kate Giriffiths,.
Here is the details

Att: Mrs Aghama Aigbe

6 Segun Sodiya Close, Thomass Estate, Lekki Ajah Lagos Nigeria
Tel:08036728811

Plaese use your UPS courier.

Kind Regards,/ Met vriendelijke groet ,/ 5-3&t]) o}z

Eric Okunde
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Qﬂwﬂd @o‘/ﬁ}é{uy/ @ Z;/
Boschdijk 600,
5624CB Eindhoven
The Netherlands
Tel: +31402938955
Email: info@queenscompanies.com

Www.queenscompanies.com

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Kate Griffiths
Verzonden: maandag 6 april 2020 12:15

Aan: Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com>
Onderwerp: Re: Newport €360 Ventilator Oxygen sensor

Hi Eric,
Thank you for your reply.

Please could | have the delivery address in Nigeria? We only use the courier UPS. | could either do a
proforma invoice for EXW or our courier UPS.

Thank you.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff
to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not be
answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate and
serve our customers as best we can.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, Apr 6, 2020 at 10:22 AM Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com> wrote:
Dear Kate Griffiths

Many thanks for your offer, please send me the invoice for 5pcs with DHL cost to Lagos Nigeria,.

Kind Regards,/ Met vriendelijke groet ,/ 5-3&t]) /&
Eric Okunde
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Boschdijk 600,
5624CB Eindhoven
The Netherlands
Tel: +31402938955
Email: info@queenscompanies.com

www.queenscompanies.com

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Kate Griffiths
Verzonden: maandag 6 april 2020 10:19

Aan: inffo@queenscompanies.com

Onderwerp: Re: Newport €360 Ventilator Oxygen sensor

Good morning Eric,

Thank you for your email.

The sensor you require for the Newport €360 Ventilator is our part number 0110429, MAX-250E.
The price is $55.20 each EXW.

If you require a proforma invoice, | would need your invoice and delivery addresses in order to set up a
new account for you.

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Please note: Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin
staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will not
be answered, but emails will. Orders may take longer to process but we aim to continue to operate
and serve our customers as best we can.
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, Apr 6, 2020 at 8:46 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Queens Company BV <info@queenscompanies.com>
Date: Sat, 4 Apr 2020 at 11:27

Subject: Newport €360 Ventilator Oxygen sensor

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir,

We are urgently interested in ordering S5pcs Newport e360 Ventilator Oxygen sensor

Please send us the offer, Thanks,.
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1620 Sunflower Ave # i
3 Phone 714 47 53"'1

Kind Regards,/ Met vriendelijke groet ,/ 5-&t])iB}{&

Eric Okunde

1y
@ Q&e@;zd %ﬁﬁ}éﬂ/}% W

Boschdijk 600,

5624CB Eindhoven

The Netherlands

Tel: +31402938955

Email: info@queenscompanies.com

www.queenscompanies.com
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