25/03/2020 Gmail - Fwd: Finger pulse oximeters

M Gma“ Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: Finger pulse oximeters

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Mar 25, 2020 at 9:32 AM
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Tue, 24 Mar 2020 at 21:50

Subject: Fwd: Finger pulse oximeters

To: <mgillard@industrywales.com>

Cc: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>, Steve Hardaker <steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk>,
<jdavies@industrywales.com>, <accountancyhelp@btconnect.com>

Hi Mike

Sorry, my understanding was that 800 finger pulse oximeters were required and maybe an additional 200 would be
required at a later stage, perhaps to be ordered by someone else.

As discussed we have 1000 units due in soon and of course we can allocate 800 to you and we will prepare a pro-
forma invoice tomorrow. Can you please confirm what the invoice address is?

800 x Part number 2810047 MD300C26 Finger Pulse Oximeters, with colour OLED display
£17.89 each + VAT EXW Viamed UK
Do you want us to ship the goods via UPS and if so would you like us to add shipment insurance?

In light of the emergency situation we had in the meantime allocated the other 200 to one of our regular ambulance
authority customers. Should the situation change we will of course check whether you would still wish to take the
additional units and will then send a further pro-forma invoice. Under the current unprecedented circumstances we
can not guarantee immediate future supplies of particular models.

As you will appreciate there is an unprecedented worldwide demand for such products at the moment.

Kind regards

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Tue, 24 Mar 2020 at 21:24

Subject: Fwd: Finger pulse oximeters

To: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mike Gillard <mgillard@industrywales.com>

Date: Tue, 24 Mar 2020 at 17:20

Subject: Finger pulse oximeters

To: office@viamed.co.uk <office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: James Davies <jdavies@industrywales.com>, Nicola Madley - Industry Wales (accountancyhelp@btconnect.com
) <accountancyhelp@btconnect.com
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25/03/2020 Gmail - Fwd: Finger pulse oximeters
Steve,

Apologies for the delay.

Please take this email as authority that Industry Wales will purchase 1,000 Finger Pulse Oximeters as discussed with
Dr Rhys Thomas at a price of £17.89 each

Please send, by return email, an invoice for the goods and we will authorise our accounts department to make an
immediate payment that will take up to 3 days to hit your bank account.

We will need these units delivered to;

CR Clarke and co (uk) limited, Unit 3 Betws Industrial Park, Ammanford SA18 2LS

Many thanks

Best regards

Mike Gillard

If you do not want to receive further emails from me click here and send the email back to me that pops up...

Rheolwr Datblygu Cadwyni Cyflenwi / Supply Chain Development Manager
Diwydiant Cymru / Industry Wales,

Canolfan Dechnoleg Waterton, Ystad Ddiwydiannol Waterton, Penybont ar Ogwr, Cymru, CF31 3WT
Waterton Technology Centre, Waterton Industrial Estate, Bridgend, Wales, CF31 3WT

+44 7557 473 691

mgillard@industrywales.com

| mLinked [0 | £

Dylai'r datganiadau neu'r sylwadau uchod gael eu trin fel rhai personol ac nid o reidrwydd fel datganiadau
neu sylwadau Diwydiant Cymru, unrhyw ran ohono neu unrhyw gorff sy'n gysylitiedig ag ef.

Ni ddylid cymryd adnabod cwmniau lleol fel cymeradwyaeth neu argymhelliad.

Any of the statements or comments made above should be regarded as personal and not necessarily
those of Industry Wales, any constituent part or connected body.
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Identification of local companies should not be taken as an endorsement or recommendation.

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.
Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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