3/23/2020 Gmail - RE: PO A/200026

M Gma" Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

RE: PO A/200026

1 message

AdmPrhoinsa <administracion@prhoinsa.com> 23 March 2020 at 14:10

To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
Cc: amelia <a.aragon@prhoinsa.com>

Hello Sarah,

Would you mind addind this reference as well?

4 units 0110024

| think the situation with the pending payments would be solved ASAP.

Thanks!!

Saludos,

Leonor Jiménez

PRHOINSA

Tel.: 91426 17 12

Fax.: 914312658
administracion@prhoinsa.com

wwww.prhoinsa.com

Aviso Legal. Esle mensaje electronico estd dingido dnicamente al destinataro designado. Su caracler es
personal, confidencial e intransferible estd protegido legalmente. Cualquier revelaciin, uso o reenvio no
autorizado, total o parcial, estd prohibido. 51 ha recibido este mensaje por error, rogamas o natifique de
inmediato a la persona que |o remite ¥ borme @l mensaje original juro con sus archivos adjuntos sin leero ni
grabarlo, fotal o parciaimente. En cumplimiento del Reglamente Europeo de Proteccion de Dalos (UE)
ETH2016, le comunicamos que su direccidn de cormeo electrdnico forma parte de un fichers con la finalidad de
mantener relaciones profesionales yo comerciales. Si lo desea puede ejercer sus derechos de acceso,
rectificacidn o supresién (el derecho al clvido™), limitacidn al tratamiento y portabilidad, dirigigndose por escrilo
al Responsable de los datos: PROYECTOS HOSPITALARIOS INTERNACIONAL, S.A. con NIF: A-82310905
y con domicilio en Calle José Abascal n® 55, 2° drcha. C.P- 2B003- MADRID y con leléfono 914-26.17.12 y
email administracion@prhoinsa.com Iguaimenta, si no desea recibir mas propuestas comerciales de nuestra
empresa, responda a este mismo corren con el asunto Borrar,
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3/23/2020 Gmail - RE: PO A/200026

De: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] En nombre de Sarah Walton
Enviado el: lunes, 9 de marzo de 2020 11:18

Para: AdmPrhoinsa

CC: amelia

Asunto: Re: PO A/200026

Dear Leonor,

Thank you for your amended purchase order.

| have added the 7 x R-17MED sensors to the order. Once payment has been received for the overdue invoices, we
can arrange for your order to be shipped.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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3/23/2020 Gmail - RE: PO A/200026

On Mon, 9 Mar 2020 at 09:22, AdmPrhoinsa <administracion@prhoinsa.com> wrote:

Hello Sarah,

We have amended the attached PO. | hope that's okay with you, could you please confirm??

Thanks!

Best regards,

Leonor Jiménez

PRHOINSA

Tel.:+34 91426 17 12
Fax.:+34 91431 26 58
administracion@prhoinsa.com

wwww.prhoinsa.com

This message and its attachments are intended solely for the addressee and may contain confidential information subject to
professional secrecy. No reproduction is forbidden or distribution without the express authorization of PROYECTOS HOSPITALARIOS
INTERNACIONAL, S.A (hereinafter PRHOINSA). If you are not the final recipient please delete and inform us in this way.

In accordance with the provisions of Law 15/1999 of December 13, Protection of Personal Data (LOPD), we inform you that your data is
stored in a file which is owned PRHOINSA in order to perform administrative, accounting and tax, and send communications regarding our

products and / or services that may be of interest.

We also inform you of the possibility of exercising rights of access, rectification, cancellation and opposition of their data
in the tax domicile of PRHOINSA located at C/JOSE ABASCAL, 55 — 2° DERECHA. 28003 - MADRID.

If you do not wish to receive information, please contact us by sending an email to the following address: administracion@prhoinsa.com
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