3/16/2020 Gmail - Re: New account

M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: New account
1 message

Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Mar 11, 2020 at 4:06 PM

Reply-To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
To: "Pipefreezing Services Ltd." <inffo@pipefreezingservicesltd.co.uk>

Many thanks for your prompt payment, | will look out for your payment in our bank account tomorrow.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in

reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Mar 11, 2020 at 3:47 PM Pipefreezing Services Ltd. <info@pipefreezingservicesltd.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Kate,
Invoice paid.

Kind regards,

Dave Andrews

Plpefreezmg
Seru[ces
Ed
Tel: 020 8859 5656
Fax: 020 8859 2255
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3/16/2020 Gmail - Re: New account
PSL have a new website! http://www.psluk.co.uk

Take a look at our Twitter! Follow us for regular updates

Or take a look at our Google Business profile, just click the icons below:

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 11 March 2020 14:47

To: Pipefreezing Services Ltd. <info@pipefreezingservicesltd.co.uk>
Subject: Re: New account

Good afternoon Andrew,

Please find attached proforma invoice as requested.

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance or if you require any changes to be made.
This item is currently in stock and we would ship as soon as possible after payment is received.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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3/16/2020 Gmail - Re: New account
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Mar 11, 2020 at 2:18 PM Pipefreezing Services Ltd. <info@pipefreezingservicesltd.co.uk> wrote:

Thanks Kate,
Delivery and invoice address are both:

Pipefreezing Services Ltd.
8 Keynsham Road
Eltham

London

SE9 6QD

Kind regards,

Jack Andrews
P ipefreezing
Semces
Ed

Tel: 020 8859 5656
Fax: 020 8859 2255

PSL have a new website! http://www.psluk.co.uk
Take a look at our Twitter! Follow us for regular updates

Or take a look at our Google Business profile, just click the icons below:

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 11 March 2020 13:40
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To: Pipefreezing Services Ltd. <info@pipefreezingservicesltd.co.uk>
Subject: Re: New account

Good afternoon Jack,

Thank you for your email.

In order to set up a new account, | just need your delivery and invoice addresses.

| can then issue you with a proforma invoice.

If in the future you would prefer to be an account customer, let me know and | will ask our accounts department
to contact you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Mar 11, 2020 at 1:34 PM Pipefreezing Services Ltd. <info@pipefreezingservicesltd.co.uk> wrote:

Hello Kate,

Following our discussion earlier, we would like to set up an account to purchase the below:

0110057 x 3.

Please can you tell me what you require to set an account up for us?

Kind regards,

Jack Andrews

ipefreezing

PSEI'E\é[CES

Tel: 020 8859 5656
Fax: 020 8859 2255

PSL have a new website! http://www.psluk.co.uk
Take a look at our Twitter! Follow us for regular updates

Or take a look at our Google Business profile, just click the icons below:
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