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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: UFO 130-2
3 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Feb 25, 2020 at 8:23 AM
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Hanson Lijing <info@lifemed.cn>
Date: Tue, 25 Feb 2020 at 04:05
Subject: UFO 130-2
To: <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Sophie

 

Is there discount if we purchase 20pcs UFO 130-2 ?

 

If yes,please issue a proforma invoice with shipping cost to HK for:

We will pay by TT

 

 

Thanks & Best Regards

Hanson Lijing

 

Lifemed Co.,Ltd

Tel.: +86 13603093265

Fax: +86 75523255830

http://www.lifemed.cn

 

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Feb 25, 2020 at 9:35 AM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Hanson Lijing <info@lifemed.cn>

Dear Hanson, 

Unfortunately we can offer a further discount for these sensors. 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

mailto:info@lifemed.cn
mailto:sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
http://www.lifemed.cn/
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Please note my working hours are Monday to Thursday, 8am - 6pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------
[Quoted text hidden]

Hanson Lijing <info@lifemed.cn> Tue, Feb 25, 2020 at 12:12 PM
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Zoey,

 

It is ok, please issue the PI with the UPS freight cost, we need keep the small box for each sensor

 

 

Thanks & Best Regards

Hanson Lijing

 

Lifemed Co.,Ltd

Tel.: +86 13603093265

Fax: +86 75523255830

http://www.lifemed.cn
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