2/24/2020 Gmail - Fwd: MaxBlend 2

M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: MaxBlend 2

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Feb 24, 2020 at 9:51 AM

To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sarah Gunn <sarahgunn@capitalairambulance.com>
Date: Mon, 24 Feb 2020 at 09:50

Subject: MaxBlend 2

To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Zoey,

Thanks for speaking with me just now.

| would like to order:

0310291 MaxBlend 2 - Low Flow 0-15 Ipm £1750.00
0320216 NIST Hose with MKIV Oxygen Probe £72.90

0320217 NIST Hose with MKIV Air Probe £72.90

Total £1895.80

I am assuming that VAT and postage will be added onto the invoice you send me.

Both delivery and invoicing addresses are:

Capital Air Ambulance
Airport House

Exeter Airport

Exeter

Devon

EX5 2BD

As soon as | receive the invoice, | will call and pay over the phone with a credit card.

Kind regards
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=d 104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1659411286451311243%7Cmsg-f%3A1659411286...
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Sarah Gunn

Clinical Coordinator

Capital Air Ambulance | Airport House | Exeter International Airport | Exeter | EX5 2BD | UK
Tel +44(0) 1392 350020 | Mob +44(0) 7734994614 | Fax +44(0) 1392 891092

Email: sarahgunn@capitalairambulance.com

Web: www.capitalairambulance.co.uk

Registered in England & Wales — Company Registration Number 2007823
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*******'k************************ATTENTION**'k****************************

Confidentiality: This email and any documents transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of
the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error please notify the sender
immediately and destroy it without further action. Any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message or any
files transmitted with it by an unauthorised recipient is strictly prohibited.
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