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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

PO

Theatre Stores <Theatre.Stores@thehospitalgroup.org> Mon, Feb 17, 2020 at 1:46 PM
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Tony Quane <TQuane@thehospitalgroup.org>, Accounts Payable Transform <accounts.payable@transform.com>,
John Fishwick <john.fishwick@transform.com>, Philip Drew <PDrew@thehospitalgroup.org>

Hi Zoey,

 

Can you please process the order below, the informa�on you have asked for is on the PO, many thanks.

 

Andy

 

TRANSFORM HOSPITAL GROUP LTD

Purchase Order

Order Number: TH021/02/20 Date: 17th Feb 2020

Order requested Tony Quane

Ordered by Andy Thompson

Supplier: Viamed
Invoice
Address

Transform Hospital Group
Ltd

Accounts Dept

192 Altrincham Road

Manchester

M22 4RZ

Fax Number: Contact: 0121 445 7500 Ext 325

https://www.google.com/maps/search/192+Altrincham+Road+Manchester+M22+4RZ?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/192+Altrincham+Road+Manchester+M22+4RZ?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/192+Altrincham+Road+Manchester+M22+4RZ?entry=gmail&source=g
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Product Code Description Qty Cost per unit Total Cost

110040 R-30v Oxygen sensors 5 45.90 229.500

    0.000

    0.000

    0.000

    0.000

    0.000

    0.000

    0.000

     

 Please deliver to:    

     

 Andy Thompson    

 Dolan Park Hospital  Nett 229.50

 Stoney Lane  VAT 45.90

 Bromsgrove     B60 1LY  Total 275.40

 

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Zoey Teal
Sent: 17 February 2020 09:58
To: Theatre Stores
Subject: Query

 

Good morning Andy, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

There will be no carriage charge for these sensors. 

 

mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
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Please can you give me the invoice and delivery address so I can send a proforma across to you? 

 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Zoey Teal

 

Please note my working hours are Monday to Thursday, 8am - 6pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

From: Theatre Stores <Theatre.Stores@thehospitalgroup.org>
Date: Fri, 14 Feb 2020 at 19:28
Subject: Query
To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Tony Quane <TQuane@thehospitalgroup.org>

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
mailto:zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:Theatre.Stores@thehospitalgroup.org
mailto:sales@viamed.co.uk
mailto:sales@viamed.co.uk
mailto:TQuane@thehospitalgroup.org
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Hi,

 

Can you please tell me if I can place an order with you for some Oxygen sensors 0110040  R-30V  using a Pro
Forma can you also tell me what the carriage charge is as well?

 

Many thanks

 

Andy

 

Kind regards,

 

Andy Thompson
Theatre Stores

The Hospital Group

Dolan Park Hospital

 

Tel:          0121 445 7500 ext 239

Fax:         0121 445 7510

Email:     theatre.stores@thehospitalgroup.org

Web:       www.thehospitalgroup.org

 

P Save a tree... Please don't print this e-mail unless you really need to

 

 

This email was sent to you by The Hospital Group. It is confidential and intended solely for the person or company to whom it is addressed. It may
contain personal or sensitive information. If you are not the intended recipient you should not copy, distribute or take any action based upon it. If you
have received this email by mistake please notify us immediately.

No employee or agent is authorised to conclude any binding agreement on behalf of Transform Hospital Group or its associated companies with
another party by email without express written confirmation by a Director.

To ensure delivery of future messages to your inbox (not bulk or junk folders), please add this email address to your address book. If you wish to stop
receiving mail from The Hospital Group or any of our affiliate companies then please send an email to unsubscribe@thehospitalgroup.org and we will
be happy to remove your email address from our database.

This message has been scanned for viruses. Although The Hospital Group maintain a high standard of computing practice we cannot be held
responsible for any viruses passed on via email and recommend you take appropriate measures of prevention.

Proprietor: Transform Hospital Group, 192 Altrincham Road, Manchester, M22 4RZ. Registration No 11932035. Tel: +44 (0) 121 445 7500 Fax: +44 (0)
121 445 7510 Web: www.thehospitalgroup.org

mailto:datkiss@thehospitalgroup.org
http://www.thehospitalgroup.org/
mailto:unsubscribe@thehospitalgroup.org
https://www.google.com/maps/search/192+Altrincham+Road,+Manchester,+M22+4RZ?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.thehospitalgroup.org/

