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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Re: Invoices

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Feb 5, 2020 at 7:58 AM
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Nejc <nejc.jakic@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 5 Feb 2020 at 07:45
Subject: Re: Invoices
To: <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sophie. 

I would like to purchase additional 10pcs of theese oxygen sensors. 

Please send me an invoice. 

Kind regards,

Nejc

On 22 May 2019, at 17:57, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
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