Subject :RE: Clover Displays LCD.

Date : Thu, 29 Mar 2007 10:53:00 +0100

Linked to :Ronnie te Lintelo

From :"Ronnie te Lintelo" <Ronnie te.Lintelo@texim-europe.com> (By way of
helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk)

To :PETER {Peter Anderson) <GoldMine User>

‘Hello Peter,

We can offer you the following:

50-pes: 6,25 EURO per piece
100-pcs: 3,61 EURO per piece

Leadtime isapprox 5 weeks ARO
Paymentterm: T/T in-advance.

Met vriendelijke groet,

Kindest regards,

Ronte Lintelo

Téxim Europeb.v.

Van: Peter Anderson [mailto:peter.anderson@viamed.co.uk]
Verzonden: woensdag 28 maart 2007 11:38

/Aan: Ronnie te Lintelo

Onderwerp: Clover Displays LCD.

Hi,

Could you please provide a quotation and delivery time for 50 off of the following LCD?
CV9018A-NN-SR-N6-KCL

Many thanks,

Best wishes,

Peter Anderson
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