7/12/2019 Gmail - DR MEDISPA ORDER

M G ma” Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

DR MEDISPA ORDER

1 message

Sara Khan <sara@drmedispa.com> 12 July 2019 at 16:07
To: Humanmeduk <logistic@humanmeduk.com>

Hello There ,

Could | please order the following and cofirm you are in receipt of this email.
WAL APPLIKATOR 370cm REF 570001 ( 1 BOX)

SUCTION BAG 3000ml

WAL CANNULA 3.8mm REF 1500 125.

Also what would be the lead time on the above order.

Thank you
Sara

On 13/05/2019 13:16, Humanmeduk wrote:
Good afternoon Sara,

Please find attached invoices as requested.
Many thanks.

Kate Giriffiths

Humanmed
0208 712 1192

2 attachments

ﬂ R121238-2.pdf
115K

ﬂ R121238-1.pdf
115K
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